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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 11:23 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Jojo Cheng; Edwin Abcede Caina; Admin A
Subject: Your Ref: CC4/AIG20014415/pa3 (SLD9486J)     Our Ref: SME5885A     DOA: 

22/12/2020
Attachments: SME5885A - Letter of Demand.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong Chew, 
 
Pls. refer to attached LOD. 
 
Our customer, Ong Teck Yen, insured with AIG claims as follows. 
 
Cost of repair                     $ 1,766.99 
Loss of rental                     $     385.20   ($128.40 x 3 days) 
GIA search fee                   $         2.00 
                                              -------------- 
Total                                    $ 2,154.19 
 
Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest. 
 
Thank you so much. 
 
 
Best regards, 
 
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 19 January 2021 5:10 PM
To: Clare Teo
Subject: RE: Your ref CC4/AIG20014415/pa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLD9486J(AIG) AND 

SME 5885A ON 22/12/2020]

Dear Ms Li Min, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your favour as your vehicle had collided onto 
third party parked vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 7 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 
1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Clare Teo <clareteo@icloud.com> 
Sent: Monday, 11 January 2021 2:01 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Your ref CC4/AIG20014415/pa3 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards, 
Li Min 
 
> On 11 Jan 2021, at 12:41 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
>  
> Hi Ms Li Min, 
>  
> Thank you for your email. 
>  
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> We have received a copy of you accident report from AIG. 
>  
> We will look into the matter. Thanks. 
>  
>  
> Best Regards, 
> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
> Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 HQ : Blk  
> 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
>  
>  
>  
> -----Original Message----- 
> From: Clare Teo <clareteo@icloud.com> 
> Sent: Saturday, 9 January 2021 5:09 PM 
> To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
> Subject: Your ref CCA/AIG20014415/pa3 
>  
> Dear Hsiao Tong, 
>  
> I refer to your letter dated 6 Jan 2021 requesting that I lodge the a GIA report within 5 working days of receipt of 
your letter.  
>  
> Please note that I have already lodged the accident report on AIG's website 26 Dec 2020. There is no change to 
that report. 
>  
> Please let me know if this will be sufficient. Thank you. 
>  
> Kind regards, 
> Li Min 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
23 Dec
2020
21:09

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> ONG TECK YEN. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
23 Dec
2020
21:09

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(202779) MITSUBISHI OUTLANDER 2.0 (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
23 Dec
2020
21:09

Clm Created
Reg No: SME5885A. Acct Date: 2020/12/22. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. L
td. (SG). TP Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG). Workshop: Cycle & Carriage Automotiv
e Pte Ltd (Pandan Gardens)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
23 Dec
2020
21:09

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
23 Dec
2020
21:09

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/01/05 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
23 Dec
2020
21:09

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
23 Dec
2020
21:09

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (E
xpress)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

8
23 Dec
2020
21:10

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

9
23 Dec
2020
21:10

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> MOHD RASUL [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
05 Jan
2021
11:30

Clm
Registration
Modified

Acct Time:09:00:00->08:55:00. Pol No:2100473823->2100473823-04.

[I] AIG
OneClaim

Integration
User

11
27 Jan
2021
09:55

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

MOHD RASUL -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

12
16 Mar
2021
13:21

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

13
16 Mar
2021
13:21

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

14
16 Mar
2021
13:21

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2018/08/27.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

15
16 Mar
2021
13:21

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

16
26 Apr
2021
10:30

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2154.19:Liability: 100% (BOLA 22)
*Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $1,766.98 + (b)LORw/GST(3d
ays x $120.00): $385.20 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $2.00 = Total: $2,154.19
*3 recommendation repa
ir days *For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

17
05 May
2021
14:02

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/01/05. Mandate Remarks: Mandate approved subject to documents
in order.
Kindly confirm with repairer and indicate in Payment Breakdown Form - payment directly to B
KW for rental invoice?

[I] Khoo, Kay-
Eng

18
05 May
2021
14:02

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:2154.19:Mandate approved subject to documents in order.
Kindly confirm with repairer and
indicate in Payment Breakdown Form - payment directly to BKW for rental invoice?

[I] Khoo, Kay-
Eng

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
[06/01/2021 17:05] HOW MEI KWAN:
OINR. To send out first letter.



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2656509 23 Dec 2020
21:18:00

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SME5885A SLD9486J 11.00

2677733 16 Mar 2021
13:21:29

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SME5885A SLD9486J 11.00
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