Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Richard,

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 17 March 2021 4:46 PM

richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg

siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg; stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; info

RE: SJE: MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July
2018 (Catherine Lim: CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

BICYCLE PURCHASE INVOICE1.pdf; BICYCLE PURCHASE INVOICE?2.jpeg; BICYCLE
PURCHASE INVOICE3.jpeg; BICYCLE PURCHASE INVOICE4.jpeg

The MV of bicycle is $18,000.00-$19,000.00 (est).
Enclosed herewith the purchase invoice.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 3:33 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: #% /< SIE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

RN richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg <richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg>

& #%: 202143 15H 15:33:05 (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
ek A s Accounts (LKKAuto) <account@lkkauto.com>; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>

$i%: siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg <siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg>; 'Catherine Lim LLC' <info@catherinelimllc.com>;
stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg <stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg>

FE[@: RE: SIE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465 and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

When replying, please keep Ms Catherine Lim in the loop.

Aside to Ms Lim, | am sorry that | did not realise that you and my assistant were not in the loop.

Richard Tan
Tan Chin Hoe & Co

From: Mary Low (LKK Account) <account@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 3:26 PM
To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg; siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SIE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Richard,



Thank you for your email.

Dear Guo Qiang,
Please assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mary Low | Account Dept

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

National Assessment Centre Services

DID: 6742 9588 | email: Account@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg [mailto:richard@tanchinhoe.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, 15 March, 2021 10:57 AM

To: 'Mary Low (LKK Account)'; siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Cc: stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; Richard (TCH)

Subject: RE: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465 and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Sirs

Can we know what is the market value of a similar bicycle please? We would appreciate if you can also provide some
evidence of the market value(be it through newspapers clippings or via posted advertisements).

Thank you.

Richard Tan
Tan Chin Hoe & Co

From: Mary Low (LKK Account) <account@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 10:52 am

To: 'info' <info@catherinelimllc.com>; siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Cc: 'Richard Tan' <richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg>; stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg;
Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SIE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

M/S Catherine Lim LLC / Siva
Thank you for your prompt arrangement of payments.
Attached please find the report of the above.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Mary Low | Account Dept



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

National Assessment Centre Services

DID: 6742 9588 | email: Account@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: info [mailto:info@catherinelimlic.com]

Sent: Friday, 12 March, 2021 5:40 PM

To: Mary Low (LKK Account); siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Cc: 'Richard Tan'; stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Subject: RE: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465] and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Mary,
Attached is the scanned copy of the cheque as requested.

Regards,

Catherine Lim LLC

(Advocates & Solicitors)

20 Havelock Road

#03-01 Central Square

Singapore 059765

(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)
Tel: 6438 5500

From: info

Sent: Friday, 12 March, 2021 5:34 PM

To: Mary Low (LKK Account) <account@lkkauto.com>; siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Cc: 'Richard Tan' <richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg>; stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg
Subject: RE: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Mary,

We will be sending out our share of the SJE fee shortly. Post out likely on Monday / Tuesday, do keep a look out for
it.

Regards,

Catherine Lim LLC

(Advocates & Solicitors)

20 Havelock Road

#03-01 Central Square

Singapore 059765

(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)
Tel: 6438 5500

From: Mary Low (LKK Account) <account@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 12 March, 2021 11:57 AM

To: siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg; info <info@catherinelimllc.com>

Cc: 'Richard Tan' <richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg>; stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg;
Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>; info <info@catherinelimllc.com>




Subject: RE: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Siva,
As per your request, attached please find invoice for your payment.
A copy : Catherine Lim

Attached please find invoice for your payment.

Please notify us once the payment is ready.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mary Low | Account Dept

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

National Assessment Centre Services

DID: 6742 9588 | email: Account@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg [mailto:siva@tanchinhoe.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 11 March, 2021 12:05 PM

To: 'Mary Low (LKK Account)'

Cc: stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; 'info’

Subject: RE: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465] and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Mary
1. We refer to our telephone conversation earlier.
2. Please let us have the revised invoice for the spilt payment for the SJE report.

Sivashankari, Paralegal

(for and on behalf of Miss Stefanie Bates)
Tan Chin Hoe & Co

24 Raffles Place

#24-01 Clifford Centre

Singapore 048621

Tel: 65382687

Fax: 65380287

Email: siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg

This email and its attachment(s) are subject to legal privilege and are intended for the recipent(s) only. If you are not
the intended recipient(s), please delete this email and its attachment(s) from your computer system immediately.



From: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 11:57 am

To: richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg; ‘Mary Low (LKK Account)' <account@lkkauto.com>; siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg
Cc: stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Subject: RE: SIE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Siva,
We confirm that we are willing to pay 50% of the SJE fee.

Regards,

Catherine Lim LLC

(Advocates & Solicitors)

20 Havelock Road

#03-01 Central Square

Singapore 059765

(UEN No. 201310922K & GST Registration No: 201310922K)
Tel: 6438 5500

From: richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg <richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March, 2021 2:57 PM

To: 'Mary Low (LKK Account)' <account@lkkauto.com>; siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Cc: info <info@catherinelimllc.com>; stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Subject: RE: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Siva, we can pay for the SJE report first.

Richard Tan
Tan Chin Hoe & Co

From: Mary Low (LKK Account) <account@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 2:39 PM

To: siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg

Cc: 'Catherine Lim LLC' <info@catherinelimllc.com>; stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg; 'Richard Tan'
<richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg>; xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465J and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

Dear Siva,

As spoken, Catherine Lim’s client is chasing very urgently.

When can | expect to receive the payment so that report can be released.
Waiting for your reply urgently.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mary Low | Account Dept

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

National Assessment Centre Services

DID: 6742 9588 | email: Account@lkkauto.com




Bk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: Mary Low (LKK Account) [mailto:account@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 22 February, 2021 2:08 PM

To: 'Catherine Lim LLC'; 'siva@tanchinhoe.com.sg'

Cc: 'stefanie@tanchinhoe.com.sg'; 'richard@tanchinhoe.com.sg'; 'xingfang@tanchinhoe.com.sg'; Guo Qiang
(LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: SJE : MC/MC 6167/2019 - Accident involving SKQ 2465] and cyclist on 5 July 2018 (Catherine Lim:
CL/180810/T/VAC; TCH: RT/SB/250/2019/sv)

M/S Catherine Lim LLC / TAN CHIN HOE & CO

The SJE Report for the above is completed.

Enclosed herewith our invoices for your payment please.
Please notify us once the payment is ready.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mary Low | Account Dept

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

National Assessment Centre Services

DID: 6742 9588 | email: Account@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




