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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 February 2021 1:04 PM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINAL BILL for SME9971H

Attachments: SME 9971H SUPPL.png; SME9971H.pdf

Hi Michelle, 

 

Finalised amount of $ 12,220.94 / 6 days of repair is confirmed 

 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee [mailto:michelle.ong@wearnes.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 9 February, 2021 5:24 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Cc: assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto) 
Subject: FINAL BILL for SME9971H 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Rasul, 

 

Please refer to Final Bill as attached. 

 
Best regards,  

Michelle Ong 

Service Consultant 

Bodyshop & Paint  

 

 

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.  

249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103 
M (65) 9129 4556  F (65) 6264 7137    

www.wearnes.com      michelle.ong@wearnes.com  
  

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.  

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.  

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 11 January 2021 9:36 AM 
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To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com> 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: SME9971H; Your Insured SKG5145R DOA 19/12/2020 

 

Dear Michelle, 

 

Noted with thanks. 

 
 

 

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

 

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>  

Sent: Monday, 11 January 2021 9:21 AM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: Re: Our Ref: SME9971H; Your Insured SKG5145R DOA 19/12/2020 

 

Dear Nivitha, 

Car will be with us at 10.30am onwards. 

Can just send your surveyor down anytime. 

Thanks, 
Michelle Ong  

Get Outlook for Android 
 

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, January 11, 2021 9:09:28 AM 

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com> 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: SME9971H; Your Insured SKG5145R DOA 19/12/2020  

  

Dear Michelle, 

  

Apologise 10-10.30am we can’t as we already have appointment on that time. 

  
  

  

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
  

* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

  

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 9 January 2021 10:26 AM 

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: SME9971H; Your Insured SKG5145R DOA 19/12/2020 

Importance: High 

  

Dear Nivitha, 

  

Please change the appt to 10am to 10.30am on Monday. 

  

Thanks. 

  
Best regards,  

Michelle Ong 
Service Consultant 

Bodyshop & Paint  

  

 

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.  
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103 
M (65) 9129 4556  F (65) 6264 7137    

www.wearnes.com      michelle.ong@wearnes.com  
  

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.  

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.  

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 

  

  

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 9:46 AM 

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com> 

Cc: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: Our Ref: SME9971H; Your Insured SKG5145R DOA 19/12/2020 

  

Dear Michelle, 

  

Appointment confirmed for SME 9971H on 11/01/2021 between 2pm-4pm. 

  
  

  

BEST REGARDS 

G.NIVITHA 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted 

  

  

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

  


