Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Serene LIM <serene@autocare.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 24 May 2021 2:36 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: aigencrypt PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST — SKH434J vs SLU318G (QOl) on
D.O.A.: 20/12/2020 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG20014368/ga3

Attachments: Benchmark Rates For Cost of Rental And Loss of use wef 01042016.pdf; Final Bill

$12,700.pdf; LTA receipt-20201222-160244.pdf

Hi Cecila

We are quantifying the belwo

Repair Cost $12, 700. 00

Loss of use $240 x 6day 1, 200. 00

(our client Maserati consider supercar range)

LTA Search 7.45

Total : $13,907. 45

Attached supporting documents. Thank you & await your reply soonest.

Serene LIM
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co
Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 I Hp: +65 96852332

E-mail: serene@autocare. com. sg

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto. com]

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 10:26 am

To: Serene LIM <serene@autocare. com. sg>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto. com>

Subject: RE: aigencrypt PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - SKH434] vs SLU318G (0I) on D.0.A.: 20/12/2020
#%k LKK REF: CC4/A1G20014368/ga3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



