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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Trident Auto <tridentauto.claims@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 11:58 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: AIGENCRYPT Liability Clearance - Accident Involving SBP8138B & SLF8285T *** 

LKK REF: CC4/AIG20014325/ba3 (LOD Submission)
Attachments: 8. FINAL INVOICE.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir/Madam,   
 
We are claiming as per below: 
 
Cost of Repair     $5,600.00 (L/sum) 
Loss of Rental     $1,620.00 (9 days x $180) 
LTA Search         $7.45 
Total                    $7,227.45 
 
Enclosed the relevant documents of our client's claims. 
 
Please look into this matter and revert for the settlement as soon as possible. 
Warmest Regards, 
ZHE CHIAN 
 
Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki bukit Ave 4 #02-44 Premier @ Kaki Bukit  
Singapore 415875 
T    (65) 6344 1918      F  (65) 6744 9778 
 
DISCLAIMER 
Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not 
misuse, copy, disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If 
you are not the intended recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. The sender shall 
not be liable for any loss or damage caused by viruses transmitted by this e-mail or its attachments. As the integrity of 
this message cannot be guaranteed, The sender shall not be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email 
may not necessarily represent the opinion of TRIDENT AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD. 
 
 
On Tue, Dec 29, 2020 at 3:23 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear 
subject to the BOLA guideline settlement. Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which 
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Our Ref: CC4/AIG20014325/Aba3 
 
02 March 2021      
     
LEE PENG CHUAN  
BLK 327 HOUGANG AVE 5 
#01-164 
SINGAPORE 530327 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLF 8285T AND SBP 8138B ON 18/12/2020. 
  
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte 
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto 
Insurance policy taken up with them. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will 
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 
claim and your NCD will be protected.  
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 

 
 
 
Jasper Chua     
DID: 6841 2928 
FAX: 6741 4108 
Email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
 

*SBP8138B (4795862399SG)
 [SLF8285T]

 TP
 G C DAIGOU

Dec 19 2020 3:00PM
 [LEE PENG CHUAN]

 Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd
 

 

 
From   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 06/05/2021 11:38 AM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$6957.45) - SBP8138B - Claim Handler: Lee, Ming-Yao
 
Approved:6957.45:May offer LOR up to S$150/day

 
DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
 There are no documents.
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