Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Trident Auto <tridentauto.claims@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 24 February 2021 11:58 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: AIGENCRYPT Liability Clearance - Accident Involving SBP8138B & SLF8285T ***
LKK REF: CC4/A1G20014325/ba3 (LOD Submission)

Attachments: 8. FINAL INVOICE.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam,
We are claiming as per below:

Cost of Repair  $5,600.00 (L/sum)

Loss of Rental  $1,620.00 (9 days x $180)
LTA Search $7.45

Total $7,227.45

Enclosed the relevant documents of our client's claims.

Please look into this matter and revert for the settlement as soon as possible.

Warmest Regards,
ZHE CHIAN

Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd

8 Kaki bukit Ave 4 #02-44 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

T (65)63441918 F (65)6744 9778

DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not
misuse, copy, disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If
you are not the intended recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. The sender shall
not be liable for any loss or damage caused by viruses transmitted by this e-mail or its attachments. As the integrity of
this message cannot be guaranteed, The sender shall not be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this email
may not necessarily represent the opinion of TRIDENT AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

On Tue, Dec 29, 2020 at 3:23 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear

subject to the BOLA guideline settlement. Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which
1



TRIDENT AUTO SERVICE CENTRE PTE LTD

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #02-44 Premier @ Kaki Bukit (Gate 1)
Singapore 415875

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
A a OGO (“the third party claimant”)
of  BLK 417 TURING WEST ST 41 %05-150 NANYAKE EMERALD) (5) U\Lfﬁl?;ddress),
owner of Sep 21238 (vehicle no.)
hereby authorize Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd (“the

workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and / or rental and / or loss of use

(“claim”) for my vehicle no. SEPa1adh that was damaged pursuant to the accident

which occurred

on_19]1] 2010 (date)along KENT yALE  RoAD
(location) involving vehicle no SLFE185T (“the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to sign the discharge voucher on my behalf to settle my above
mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the

workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver / owner / insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this Al day of ¥ (month)20 20 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by 741e workshop”
Policyholder’s Signature only ’
& Company Chop - (if registered under a company)



Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #02-44 Date
Premier @ Kaki Bukit (Gate 1) Vehicle
Singapore 415875 Make/Model
Tel: 63441918 ORD

Chassis
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd oDo
78 Shenton Way, #09-16 AIG Building ACC Date

Singapore 079120

Final Invoice

:21/12/2020

: SBP8138B

: Toyota Alphard 2.55
12015

: AGH300013034
1236283
:19/12/2020

S/N Qty Description & Specification Amount S$
List Items
1 1 Tailgate $1,718.00
2 1 Tailgate ‘ALPHARD' emblem $96.40
3 1 Tailgate lock w/auto motor $415.80
4 1 Tailgate w/stripe $335.20
5 1 Tailgate inner trim board $526.00
6 1 Rear w/screen moulding top $58.00
7 1 Rear w/screen moulding bottom $58.00
8 1 Rear w/screen moulding LH $45.00
9 1 Rear w/screen moulding RH $45.00
10 1 Rear bumper 51,146.80
11 1 Rear bumper tow cover $60.40
12 1 Rear bumper side retainer LH $77.10
13 1 Rear bumper side retainer RH $77.10
14 1 Rear bumper reverse sensor inner LH $272.60
15 1 Rear end panel $745.20
16 1 Rear end panel top garnish $259.80
Less 25%  $1,484.10
List Total ~ $4,452.30
Supplementary ltems
1 1set Reverse Camera $400.00
S/Nett Total  $400.00
§/Nett Items
1 lset Tailgate inner trim board clips $30.00
2 1set Rear w/screen sealant $40.00
3 1set Rear w/screen inner seal $30.00
4 lset Rear bumper clips $30.00
5 lset Rear bumper reverse sensor o-ring $40.00
6 lset Rear end panel sealant $60.00
7 Iset Rear end panel top garnish clips $20.00
S/Nett Total  $250.00
Labour
1 To cut, weld rear end panel, to replace tailgate assy, to repair
rear floor panel and re-align on all accident affected areas $800.00
2 To putty and respray on rear accident portion $800.00
3 To check rear lighting and wiring $30.00
4 To apply anti-rust corrosion on rear affected areas $60.00
5 To remove and refit rear w/screen $120.00
6 To transfer tailgate mechanism to new tailgate $80.00
7 To remove and refit rear garnish, upholstery etc to assist repair $60.00

N

Trident Auto Se

ice Centre Pte Ltd

Labour Total  $1,950.00
Grand Total ~ $7,052.30
L/S Less 20%  $1,410.46
L/S Grand Total $5,641.84
Finalized Amt  $5,600.00



> Back to OneMotoring

Land ?z‘;mﬁmﬂ&f‘km hority

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time :

22 Dec 2020 / 10:15:41

Receipt Date/Time : 22 Dec 2020 / 10:15:41

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201222-000965
Previous Receipt No. :

S/IN ltem Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SLF8285T
As at 19 Dec 2020/14:55:00
Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SLF8285T
Enquiry Fee
20201222101249135440
Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable

Paid By
454750XXXXXX9785
Total

Cash Change
Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (S$) (S$)
7.00 0.49
7.00 0.49
7.00 0.49

eNETS Credit Card

Amount
After GST
(S$)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45
7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.
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