Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Auburn Auto <auburnauto.insurance@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 17 February, 2021 10:07 AM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: K.Cerato SJIM2975L repair estimate

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Dear Sun Pin,

Please proceed.

Kindly address the cheque to: AUBURN AUTO PTE LTD
Mail to: 176 Sin Ming Drive (AutoCare) #04-18, Singapore 575721

Thanks and Best Regards
Claims Dept
9093 8998

On Tue, Feb 9, 2021 at 5:39 PM Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin @lkkauto.com> wrote:
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Jen,
Good day, regarding your request for L/SUMP repair cost need $ 1,700, that have too high for the COR.

at last I have adjust the repair cost L/SUMP amount COR $ 1,650 and DOR 3 DAY.

Kindly to take noted, will be base finalized amount COR $1,650 and DOR 3 DAYS to close this case.
Thank you

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pinl Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933




From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, February 3, 2021 9:48 AM

To: Auburn Auto <auburnauto.insurance@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: K.Cerato SIM2975L repair estimate

Hi Sir,

Kindly refer the finalize amount $1,500 (before gst). Repair day 3 days under lump sum repair.
Please confirm the COR by reply email.

Thank you

Best Regards,
Ol Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: Auburn Auto [mailto:auburnauto.insurance@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2020 5:10 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: K.Cerato SIM2975L repair estimate

Dear Sun Pin,
Please find the above mentioned as attached.

Thanks and Best Regards
Claims Department
9093 8998



