Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 2:39 PM

To: Ho Yue Meng

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Photos and list on supplementary items, before paint and Finalised Bill for SCF12Z
Attachments: SCF 12(SUPPL).png; FINALISED - SCF12Z.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Mr Ho,

Finalised amount of $ 5,238.46 / 5 days of repair is confirmed

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
74 74
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From: Ho Yue Meng [mailto:ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com]

Sent: Saturday, 16 January, 2021 9:32 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Photos and list on supplementary items, before paint and Finalised Bill for SCF12Z
Importance: High

Dear Mr Rasul,

Please refer to additional photos on the supplementary item
which was omitted in our earlier message.

Best Regards

YM Ho

TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd

No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road
Singapore 628099

DID : 67038432



From: Ho Yue Meng

Sent: 16 January, 2021 9:09 AM

To: rasul@lkkauto.com

Subject: Photos and list on supplementary items, before paint and Finalised Bill for SCF12Z
Importance: High

Dear Ms Jaclyn,

Please find attached photos before paint for SCF12Z.

Also, please find attached supplementary items list and finalised bill for SCF12Z.

Total Repair Days : 5 Days

Thank-you.

Best Regards

YM Ho

TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd

No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road
Singapore 628099

DID : 67038432



