
5/13/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%… 1/3

Re: LOD Y/ref: SLW2745H O/ref: DS/2368087/SJY5575A DOA 16.12.20 Our Ref:
20/20/21/VP05/024018 [External General]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Thu 13/5/2021 11:36 AM
To:  PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

1 attachments (212 KB)
DV_SJY5575A.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above ma�er. 
  
We confirm se�lement as follows: - 
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 15,086.52
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $100.00)(w/GST) $       428.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $           2.00

Total $ 15,516.52

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary ac�on. 

“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of

resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 9:36 AM 
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
<Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Re: LOD Y/ref: SLW2745H O/ref: DS/2368087/SJY5575A DOA 16.12.20 Our Ref:
20/20/21/VP05/024018 [External General]
 
Dear Sirs,

Please let us have your offer of settlement.

Thank you.

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com


5/13/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%… 2/3

Regards,
Melanie
DID: 6319 0175 Fax: 6479 4601
c/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 
Sent: Monday, 19 April 2021 12:06 PM 
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>; 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: LOD Y/ref: SLW2745H O/ref: DS/2368087/SJY5575A DOA 16.12.20 Our Ref:
20/20/21/VP05/024018 [External General]
 
[External Mail] This email originated from outside of the organisation; be careful with requests,

attachments and links.

Lonpac External - General
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
fya
 
Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.
 
From: PBSP [mailto:pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 16 April 2021 11:36 AM 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: LOD Y/ref: SLW2745H O/ref: DS/2368087/SJY5575A DOA 16.12.20
 
Hi,
 
We refer to the above.
 
A�ached herewith copy of our LOD dated 12.04.21 and all it suppor�ng documents for your perusal.
 
Please let us have your offer soon.
 
Originals are in the mail.
 
Regards,
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Evelyn 
c/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0175 Fax: 6479 4601
 
“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for
the named addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged
and/or proprietary to the Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under
applicable laws. If you are not the intended Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using,
disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby disclaims all liability for
any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or other
malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the
author's and do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”


