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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: lee ahbee <ahbeelee@hotmail.sg>
Sent: May 3, 2021 7:38 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] - Request for direct settlement: Accident involving SJF3387P and your 

insured SHD3274R on 10 Dec 2020
Attachments: IMG_3299.20.FRB & LOA.pdf

Your Ref: CC4/III20014097/Qbs3 
Our Ref: 3299/20/SHK (SJF3387P) 
 
'Without Prejudice' 
 
Dear Jasper, 
 
We refer to your email dated 27 April 2021. 
 
We are pleased to proceed with a direct settlement at $5,060.00, comprises repair cost $4,700.00 and 
loss of use $360.00 ($60x6) to resolve the matter. 
 
Please find attached the Final Repair Bill together with the Letter of Authorization for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us know whether India International Insurance are agreeable to settle for the above. 
 
Thank you ! 
 
 
Best Regards 
Ah Bee Lee 
Seng Hong Kee Co 
Blk 4 Woodlands Road 393-F 
Yew Tee Industrial Estate Singapore 677976 
HP:96996650 Tel:67605120 Fax:67602129 
 
Sent from Outlook 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 27, 2021 10:18 AM 
To: ahbeelee@hotmail.sg <ahbeelee@hotmail.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - Request for direct settlement: Accident involving SJF3387P and your insured SHD3274R on 10 
Dec 2020  
  
Hi Ah Bee Lee, 
  
Liability is clear , can do direct settlement. 



AUTHORTZATTON TO ACT

t

r, Lcre-Sr.^ SI*iq - - ("the third part'v
cl a inrat:t" )

of t\81S ( address )

owner of (vehicle no. ) herel:y author i ze

("The worksl-top") to act for me with respect tO my Clairn for

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("c1aim") for my

Vehj.cle No, SJL)_38+*_ that was damaged pursuant to the

accider:t which occurred on l9!d]313 (date) along l"*"k-^'
( Iocation)

involvins vehicre No/s -SJS 33ftf -+ sllD 3at\R -
( "The acci-dent " ) '

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned
cl.aim in a mannel that they deem fit and the workshop is further
authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
r+itlr paymenL chequo/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I fr.Lrtl-rer acknowledge that any settlement Lhe workshop may reach

on my l:el"ralf is on a without prejudice and without admission of
ria):il-ity basis insofar as the driver/owuer/insurers of the
other vehicle/s is concerned'

Dated tlris LY dav of Ail)*
--=:--T----r

year )

Si.gnect ):y "t}:e tt)ird party claimant" Signed by "the workshoP"





fr*-

SENG HONG KEE CO. INVOICE
BLOCK 4, 393-F WOODLANDS ROAD (YEWTEE INDUSTRIAL ESTATE)

SINGAPORE 677976 TEL:6760 5120 FAX:67602129

. + $r ir1|uf,T"'Htt#t"ff8 #.- + .
Motor Vehicles Repairing, welding and Spray Painting NO. 6 7 8 0

aL 't itl

Our Ref: 3299DAlSl{J(.

Date:30 Apd202l

Motor Claims Department
lndia International Insurance Singapore
64 Cecil Street #05- IOB Building
Singapore U971I

Final bill of repair to vehicle Registration No: SJF 3387 P

We agreed to your surveyor's recommendation for the final repair cost to be at a lump
sum of dollars Four Thousand And Seven Hundred only ($4,700.00)

This repair cost includes the cost of spare pds, labour charge and spray paint.

n#- r+ ie A El

SENG HONG KEB CO



5/11/2021 Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1839837&iDomainId=11&iObjId=10684… 1/2

Reply  Reply All  Mark as Unread  Print Message  Delete Message  Forward  

 

 

View Received Message

This mail is associated with :
 

*SJF3387P (MCT20120197)
 [SHD3274R]

TP
 LOE SU SENG

 Dec 10 2020 4:00AM
 [-]

 Seng Hong Kee Co
 

 

 
From   India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 03/05/2021 14:32 PM.
To   LKK_HQ
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$5060.00) - SJF3387P - Claim Handler: Bhargavi Purushothaman Dhanya
 
Approved:5060.00.

 
DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
 There are no documents.
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