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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Ng, Thaddaeus-HC <Thaddaeus-HC.Ng@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 11:17 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Lim, Kok-Chong; Fong, Andy-SY

Subject: Re:  RE: FBN 2485Z OD DOA: 12/12/2020 Net Loss

Hi,  

 

Pls advise repairer accordingly as per MV update calculated. if not acceptance will be treated as TTL case. 

Regards  

Thaddaeus  

 

 

On 24 Dec 2020, at 11:08 AM, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Thaddaeus, 

  

According to the repairer, they are unable to accept the net loss of $4,100.00. 

  

Kindly advise. 

  

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Ng, Thaddaeus-HC <Thaddaeus-HC.Ng@aig.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 24 December 2020 10:04 AM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 

<bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FBN 2485Z OD DOA: 12/12/2020 Net Loss 

  

Hi,                               Important 

  

Mandate not approve. 

  

Preliminary advise created with net loss $5,500/- with margin repair. 

  

Market value uploaded for July 2018 $7,800/- as per bike registered Aug 2018 

which is closed for calculation. 
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Margin repair for net loss should be $4,100/- to counter offer to repairer and 

prelim to revise. 

  
Thaddaeus Ng 
Motor Claims Surveyor 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
  
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Hp +(65) 8876 5433 
Thaddaeus-HC.Ng@AIG.com  |  www.aig.sg 
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