Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Without Prejudice

Hi Mak,

TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Friday, 15 January 2021 11:15 AM

Daniel Mak

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJB5939E & GBJ8768P ON 12 DEC 2020 AT 18:15

Can you confirm that you accept our offer of COR for SJB 5939E at $7,400.00 with 8 repair days, subjected to approval of the

insurance company.

If you are agreeable to our offer please send the necessary documents to our Case Handler Ms Veron Chen.

Regards,
TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Daniel Mak [mailto:mak.auburnauto@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 14 January, 2021 1:09 PM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIB5939E & GBJ8768P ON 12 DEC 2020 AT 18:15

Hi Lim,

Can I have the finalisation for this car, thanks.

with regards

Mak

Auburn Auto Pte Ltd
+65 9773 6360

On Mon, 21 Dec 2020 at 16:25, Daniel Mak <mak.auburnauto @ gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Lim,

This is the updated estimates as requested.

Kindly advise, thanks.

with regards

Mak

Auburn Auto Pte Ltd
+65 9773 6360



On Sat, 19 Dec 2020 at 07:29, TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Daniel,

| am Lim not Teo.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Regards,

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Daniel Mak [mailto:mak.auburnauto@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 18 December, 2020 4:31 PM

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIB5939E & GBJ8768P ON 12 DEC 2020 AT 18:15

Hi Teo,

These are the documents as requested.

Kindly advise.



with regards
Mak
Auburn Auto Pte Ltd

+65 9773 6360



