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Re: REMINDER - YOUR REF : 8542020541SG003 OUR REF : GBC 2546 P ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBC 2546 P & SJT 1909 Z ALONG NEAR 4 TECK WHYE LANE OPPOSITE OF
CHINESE TEMPLE ON 14 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 0710 HOURS - ACCEPTANCE

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sat 27/2/2021 1:55 PM
To:  claims@focusauto.com.sg <claims@focusauto.com.sg>
Cc:  focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg>

1 attachments (195 KB)
DV_GBC 2546P.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us(LKK) for our necessary
ac�on: -

Authorisa�on to Act signed by your client.

Thanks. 

“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of

resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Focus Auto Pte Ltd <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 12:50 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
Subject: REMINDER - YOUR REF : 8542020541SG003 OUR REF : GBC 2546 P ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 2546 P &
SJT 1909 Z ALONG NEAR 4 TECK WHYE LANE OPPOSITE OF CHINESE TEMPLE ON 14 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT
0710 HOURS - ACCEPTANCE
 

Dear Hsiao Tong
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We are pleased to inform you that your offer is accepted.

Kindly forward the Discharge Voucher to us.

Thank you

Best Regards 

Jenny Koh

Focus Auto Pte Ltd
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
#02-50
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800



2/27/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2BZ… 3/7

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: 2/25/21 9:33 AM 
To: "claims@focusauto.com.sg" <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
Cc: "focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg" <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: REMINDER - YOUR REF : 8542020541SG003 OUR REF : GBC 2546 P ACCIDENT
INVOLVING GBC 2546 P & SJT 1909 Z ALONG NEAR 4 TECK WHYE LANE OPPOSITE OF CHINESE
TEMPLE ON 14 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 0710 HOURS - STATUS

Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
 
We propose settlement as follows: -
 

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,745.00
2. Loss of Rental (6days x $80.00) $    480.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $      31.00

Total $ 4,256.00
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 

 
 
From: Focus Auto Pte Ltd <claims@focusauto.com.sg>  
 Sent: Saturday, 20 February 2021 2:52 PM 
 To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
 Cc: focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg 
 Subject: REMINDER - YOUR REF : 8542020541SG003 OUR REF : GBC 2546 P ACCIDENT INVOLVING
GBC 2546 P & SJT 1909 Z ALONG NEAR 4 TECK WHYE LANE OPPOSITE OF CHINESE TEMPLE ON 14
DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 0710 HOURS - STATUS
 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com


2/27/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2BZ… 4/7

 
We refer to the above mentioned.
 
Kindly advise on the status.
 
Appreciate your assistance and prompt reply.
 
Thank you
 
 
Best Regards 

Jenny Koh
 
Focus Auto Pte Ltd
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
 #02-50
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883 
 Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
 Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800
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From: "Focus Auto Pte Ltd" <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
 Sent: 1/30/21 12:26 PM 
 To: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
 Cc: "focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg" <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
 Subject: YOUR REF : 8542020541SG003 OUR REF : GBC 2546 P ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 2546 P &
SJT 1909 Z ALONG NEAR 4 TECK WHYE LANE OPPOSITE OF CHINESE TEMPLE ON 14 DECEMBER
2020 AT ABOUT 0710 HOURS - STATUS
 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
We refer to the above mentioned.
 
Kindly advise on the status.
 
Appreciate your assistance and prompt reply.
 
Thank you
 
 
Best Regards 

Jenny Koh
 
Focus Auto Pte Ltd
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
 #02-50
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883 
 Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
 Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800
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From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
 Sent: 1/13/21 2:24 PM 
 To: "claims@focusauto.com.sg" <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
 Cc: "focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg" <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
 Subject: RE: YOUR REF : 8542020541SG003 OUR REF : GBC 2546 P ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 2546
P & SJT 1909 Z ALONG NEAR 4 TECK WHYE LANE OPPOSITE OF CHINESE TEMPLE ON 14
DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 0710 HOURS - LOD
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Jenny,
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 13 Jan 2021.
 
We will look into the matter and get back to you.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 

 
 
From: Focus Auto <claims@focusauto.com.sg>  
  Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 12:27 PM 
  To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
  Cc:  focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg 
  Subject: YOUR REF : 8542020541SG003 OUR REF : GBC 2546 P ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 2546 P
& SJT 1909 Z ALONG NEAR 4 TECK WHYE LANE OPPOSITE OF CHINESE TEMPLE ON 14 DECEMBER
2020 AT ABOUT 0710 HOURS - LOD
 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
Kindly refer to the attached for your reference and necessary action.
 
Thank you
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Best Regards 

Jenny Koh
 
Focus Auto Pte Ltd
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
  #02-50
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883 
  Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
  Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800


