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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 December 2020 4:03 PM

To: Lily Loi

Cc: Kaitlyn Chio; SUR

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM - SKE1231L MERCEDES BENZ CLA180 DOA 21/11/2019 (UOI)

 

 

Dear Sir, 

  

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SKE1231L (Excess $750/-). 

  

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to 

arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

  

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before 

completion of the repair. 

  

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 6:46 PM 

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>; Eve Tan <Eve.tan@ow.sg> <Eve Tan <Eve.tan@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An 

<tingan.ling@ow.sg> <Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg> <Victor Seng 

<victor.seng@ow.sg> 

Subject: RE: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM - SKE1231L MERCEDES BENZ CLA180 DOA 21/11/2019 (UOI) 

 

Hi Denise, 

 

FYI. 

 

--  

Best Regards, 

 

Lily Loi (Ms.) 
Senior Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department  

D: +65 6481 1522 | F: +65 6481 1011 
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www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz 

 
Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any purpose, 

nor disclose its contents to any other person.  

Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content immediately after which. 

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 2:56 PM 

To: Lily Loi <lily.loi@ow.sg> 

Cc: Kaitlyn Chio <kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>; Eve Tan <Eve.tan@ow.sg> <Eve Tan <Eve.tan@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An 

<tingan.ling@ow.sg> <Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg> <Victor Seng 

<victor.seng@ow.sg> 

Subject: OWN DAMAGE CLAIM - SKE1231L MERCEDES BENZ CLA180 DOA 21/11/2019 (UOI) 

 

Hi Lily, 

 

Can help me to ask insured for his LTA log card? 

 
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


