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From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com> 

Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 12:00 pm

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: LOD For Our Insured Veh SJR1253S

 

Dear Ms Chris Lim,
 

RE: ACCIDENT ON 07/12/2020 @18:00HRS
ALONG 8 HOUGANG AVE 8
INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJR1253S & SHD3476A
YOUR CLAIM REF: D20005019MFSH
 
We understand that you are the insurer of  SHD3476A   vehicle.
 
I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SJR1253S  have been completed repairs to my/our satisfaction by
M/s  NGS Motorsport Pte Ltd  . I/We therefore propose to claim from you as follow:-
 

a) Cost of Repair                     $1550.00
b) LOU 5days @$60.00          $  300.00 (Include Survey)
c) LTA Search                         $      7.45

                                                            $1857.45

 
A copy each of the following supporting documents is attached
 

a)      Authorise to act

b)      Cert of insurance

c)      Our bill M/S NGS MotorSport Pte Ltd

d)      SHD3476A LTA Search Fee

e)      SJR1253S SAS Report

f)       Driver Contract











Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 11 Dec 2020 / 16:14:48

Receipt Date/Time : 11 Dec 2020 / 16:14:46

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201211-003163

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount
Before

GST (S$)

GST
Amount

(S$)

Amount
After GST 

(S$)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHD3476A
As at 07 Dec 2020/18:00:00
Insurance Co: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED

1 Insurance Enquiry - SHD3476A
Enquiry Fee 
20201211161206876770

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

426588XXXXXX1986 eNETS Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 2:12 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Our Ref : D20005019MFSH / Your Ref : SJR1253S / 

Accident involving SHD3476A & SJR1253 S on 07/12/20.

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Dear Asher, 
 

Pls offer as per below: 
 

COR - $1,550 

LOU - $200 to $250 ($50 x 4 to 5 days) 

LTA - $7.45 

TOTAL - $1,757.45 to $1,807.45 

 

Regards 

 

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

  

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

  

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

  

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 

whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 

error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-

mail. 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 12:46 pm 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Our Ref : D20005019MFSH / Your Ref : SJR1253S / Accident 
involving SHD3476A & SJR1253 S on 07/12/20. 
 

Your ref : D20000311MFSH 

Our ref : CC4/FCI20000863/Kea3q2 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 368P (OI) AND GBE 9263Z (TP) ON 10/01/2020 

  



2

We refer to the above matter. 

  

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. 

  

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 

  

We seek your approval to offer repairer " NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD  " at $ 1,857.45 (all-in). 

  

The summary is as follows: - 

  

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised   

1. Cost of Repairs $  5,915.84 $ 1,550.00   

2. Loss of Use (5days x $60) $      300.00 $    300.00 (5days x $60) 

3. LTA Search Fee $          7.45 $        7.45 

Total $  6,223.29 $ 1,857.45 

  

Surveyor recommended 4days for repair. 

  

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

  

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 

 

 

Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 7 January 2021 11:08 AM 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Our Ref : D20005019MFSH / Your Ref : SJR1253S / Accident involving SHD3476A & 
SJR1253 S on 07/12/20. 
 

Hi Chris, 
 

We acknowledge your email below. 
 

We will prepare our report and seek approval in due course. 
 



3

Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, January 4, 2021 3:04 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: Our Ref : D20005019MFSH / Your Ref : SJR1253S / Accident involving SHD3476A & SJR1253 
S on 07/12/20.  
  
Dear Asher, 

  

Attached herewith the LOD from TP which I had already acknowledge. 

  

Kindly follow-up. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

  

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. 

No. 195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

  

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

  

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 

whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 

error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-

mail. 

  

From: ngs motorsport <ngsmotorsportpteltd@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 12:00 pm 

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject: LOD For Our Insured Veh SJR1253S 
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Dear Ms Chris Lim, 
  

RE: ACCIDENT ON 07/12/2020 @18:00HRS 

ALONG 8 HOUGANG AVE 8 

INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SJR1253S & SHD3476A 

YOUR CLAIM REF: D20005019MFSH 

  

We understand that you are the insurer of   SHD3476A   vehicle. 

  

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle  SJR1253S  have been completed repairs to my/our 
satisfaction by M/s  NGS Motorsport Pte Ltd  . I/We therefore propose to claim from you as follow:- 

  

a) Cost of Repair                     $1550.00 

b) LOU 5days @$60.00          $  300.00 (Include Survey) 

c) LTA Search                         $      7.45 

                                                            $1857.45  

  

A copy each of the following supporting documents is attached 

  

a)      Authorise to act 

b)      Cert of insurance 

c)      Our bill M/S NGS MotorSport Pte Ltd 

d)      SHD3476A LTA Search Fee 

e)      SJR1253S SAS Report 

f)       Driver Contract  

  

Your early reply to the above claims would therefore be much appreciated. 
  

Your faithfully, 
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Evelyn Ng 

DID HP 9695 5547 

  
NGS MOTORSPORT PTE LTD 
Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2a 
#02-01 AMK AutoPoint 
Singapore 568047 
  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  


