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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 9 February 2021 9:13 AM
To: claims@focusauto.com.sg
Cc: focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg
Subject: RE: YOUR REF : SMV 8735 R   OUR REF : SJE 7535 H   ACCIDENT INVOLVING  SJE 

7535 H & SMH 2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 
AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - ACCEPTANCE

Attachments: DV_SJE7535H.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our necessary 
action: - 
 

 Authorisation to Act signed by your client.  
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Focus Auto Pte Ltd <claims@focusauto.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 8 February 2021 10:14 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg 
Subject: YOUR REF : SMV 8735 R OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 7535 H & SMH 2847 P ALONG PIE 
BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - ACCEPTANCE 
 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
We are pleased to inform you that your offer is accepted. 
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Kindly forward the Discharge Voucher to us. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
Best Regards 

Jenny Koh 
 

Focus Auto Pte Ltd 

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
#02-50 

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800 
 

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: 2/7/21 12:37 PM 
To: "claims@focusauto.com.sg" <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
Cc: "focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg" <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: RE-SEND - YOUR REF : SMV 8735 R OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 
7535 H & SMH 2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 
HOURS - AMENDED LOD 
 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,060.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
 

From: Focus Auto Pte Ltd <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
Sent: Wednesday, 27 January 2021 10:31 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
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Subject:RE-SEND - YOUR REF : SMV 8735 R OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 7535 H & 
SMH 2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - 
AMENDED LOD 
  
 
Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
As per requested, kindly refer to the attached for youre reference and necessary action. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
Best Regards 

Jenny Koh 
 

Focus Auto Pte Ltd 

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
 #02-50 

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 
 Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
 Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800 
 

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
 Sent: 1/26/21 1:48 PM 
 To: "claims@focusauto.com.sg" <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
 Cc: "focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg" <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
 Subject: RE: YOUR REF : SMV 8735 R OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 7535 H & SMH 
2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - THIRD 
PARTY REPORT'S TAX INVOICE 
 
Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Jenny, 

  

Kindly assist to indicate the $29.00 search fee in your LOD and resend your LOD to us. Thanks. 

  

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Focus Auto <claims@focusauto.com.sg>  
  Sent: Friday, 15 January 2021 2:23 PM 
  To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
  Cc: focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg 
  Subject: YOUR REF : SMV 8735 R OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 7535 H & SMH 
2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - THIRD 
PARTY REPORT'S TAX INVOICE 

  

  

Dear Hsiao Tong 

  

We refer to the above mentioned. 

  

Kindly include $29.00 (purchase Third Party's Report) into your settlement.  We only managed to get it by today. 

  

Tax Invoice as per attached. 

  

Sorry for all the inconvenience caused. 

  

Thank you 
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Best Regards 

Jenny Koh 

  

Focus Auto Pte Ltd 

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
  #02-50 

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 
  Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
  Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800 

  

From: "Focus Auto" <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
  Sent: 12/31/20 11:48 AM 
  To: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
  Cc: "focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg" <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
  Subject: YOUR REF : SMH 2847 P OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 7535 H & SMH 
2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - LOD 

  

  

Dear Hsiao Tong 

  

As per requested, kindly refer to the attached for your reference and necessary action. 

  

Sorry for all the inconvenience caused. 

  

Thank you 

  

  

Best Regards 

Jenny Koh 
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Focus Auto Pte Ltd 

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
  #02-50 

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 
  Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
  Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800 

  

From: "Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
  Sent: 12/22/20 11:30 AM 
  To: "claims@focusauto.com.sg" <claims@focusauto.com.sg> 
  Cc: "focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg" <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg> 
  Subject: RE: YOUR REF : SMH 2847 P OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 7535 H & SMH 
2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - LOD 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Jenny, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

SMH2847P(last car) -> SMV8735R(Our insured-AIG) -> SJE7535H(Your client) 

  

Please be informed that our ref vehicle should be SMV8735R(AIG). Kindly assist to amend you LOD & resend 
to us. 

  

We are currently preparing report to seek mandate from AIG and will get back to you asap. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole 
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, 
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 



7

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Focus Auto <claims@focusauto.com.sg>  
   Sent: Monday, 21 December 2020 3:48 PM 
   To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
   Cc:   focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg 
   Subject: YOUR REF : SMH 2847 P OUR REF : SJE 7535 H ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJE 7535 H & SMH 
2847 P ALONG PIE BEFORE TOA PAYOH EXIT ON 1 DECEMBER 2020 AT ABOUT 1830 HOURS - LOD 

  

  

Dear Hsiao Tong 

  

Kindly refer to the attached for your reference and necessary action. 

  

Thank you 
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Best Regards 

Jenny Koh 

  

Focus Auto Pte Ltd 

No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
   #02-50 

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 417883 
   Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 68444625 
   Office Hours : Mon ~ Sat, 0900 ~ 1800 


