
 
 
 
Our Ref: CC4/AIG20013753/Kps3 
 
01 FEB 2021 
 
DAIMLER SOUTH EAST ASIA PTE LTD 
Westgate Tower 
1 Gateway Drive #15-01 
Singapore 608531 
Attention: The Management 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMP 3968A(AIG) AND SMP 3716K ALONG/AT BUKIT BATOK RD 
T-JUNCTION OF BUKIT BATOK WEST AVE ON 07/11/2020 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by 
your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your 
policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SMP 3716K against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your driver’s 
favour as it is a head-to-rear collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement 
with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please 
contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for 
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a 
NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
 
 
CHEW HSIAO TONG 
Case Handler 
DID: 6742 3197 
FAX: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 
 
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 11:18 AM
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: 9425999959SG-003 LKK REF : CC4/AIG20013753/Kes3

Hi Bernard, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Third party repairer inform claimant have withdrawn the claim. 
 
In view we will submit our w/p report and close off the case. 
 
Thank You.  
 
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 December 2021 5:24 PM 
To: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: 9425999959SG-003 LKK REF : CC4/AIG20013753/Kes3 
 
 
Dear Sir / Madam,  
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Asher, 
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FYNA, CC4/AIG20013753/Kes3 
 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

  

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 

                                                               

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li| Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 
 

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ <Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, December 22, 2021 4:49 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 9425999959SG-003  
  
Hi LKK, 
  
The subject matter refers. 
  
Kindly assist to provide update/ last correspondence with TP’s repairer on the claim. 
There is no need to notify TP if there is no development. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Best Regards, 
  
Bernard Ler 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1946  
  
Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
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IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


