Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 February 2021 6:11 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Su Li (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SJK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST SHC5767C DOA 11.12.2020 LKK REF :
CC4/ASM20013731/Ags3

Attachments: SJK3074R DV.pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi Cecilia
Enclosed signed discharge voucher with company stamp for your reference.

Since last year AXA already start GIRO the payment to our company therefore, they have our company bank
details, thanks.

*** Please expedite the necessary submission to AXA to make the payment to us, thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 16, 2021 5:13 PM

To: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJK3074R CLAIMING AGAINST SHC5767C DOA 11.12.2020 LKK REF : CC4/ASM20013731/Ags3
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sukyi,

Thanks for your acceptance.

Kindly sign on DV + payment mode form as attached and email back to us (LKK).

Thanks



