5/11/22, 4:34 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: SKZ 834T DOA:05/12/2020 SOMPO

Christina <christina@1ap.com.sg>
Wed 11/5/2022 3:19 PM
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>

Hi Denise,

Please close both cases.

We'll forward LOD to insurance in due course.
Thanks and best regards,

Christina Tan
Business Development Manager

15t Auto Pro Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Office @ #01-49 | Ws @ #01-51 & 52
Singapore 415875 | DID: 8718 6767

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 11, 2022 2:49 PM

To: Christina <christina@lap.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SKZ 834T DOA:05/12/2020 SOMPO

Dear Christina,
enclosed 2 estimates for your confirmation.

SKX 834T - Lump sum $14,000/-, 17 days
SLU 4482M - Lump sum $6,100/- 6 days

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Christina <christina@2lap.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 May 2022 1:02 pm
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5/11/22, 4:34 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKZ 834T DOA:05/12/2020 SOMPO

Christina Tan
Business Development Manager

1% Auto Pro Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Office @ #01-49 | Ws @ #01-51 & 52
Singapore 415875 | DID: 8718 6767

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, May 11, 2022 12:42 PM

To: Christina <christina@l1ap.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SKZ 834T DOA:05/12/2020 SOMPO

Dear Chris,

| need the price to be updated in the estimate.
Long due outstanding. Year 2020

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Christina <christina@2lap.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 June 2021 3:04 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKZ 834T DOA:05/12/2020 SOMPO

Dear Denise,

Repair is done.

Please let us have the finalized amount.
Thanks and best regards,

Christina Tan
Business Development Manager
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5/11/22, 4:34 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

1%t Auto Pro Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Office @ #01-49 | Ws @ #01-51 & 52
Singapore 415875 | DID: 9188 3197

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 8, 2021 2:59 PM

To: Christina <christina@2lap.com.sg>

Subject: SKZ 834T DOA:05/12/2020 SOMPO

Hi,

Would like to check on the status. do let me know if repair done and can be finalise, i will get the
surveyor to do so.

Thanks and regards,

Denise

Case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 7 62563561 Fax: & 6256 4315
Email: [=7 sur@lkkauto.com
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