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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, 3 June 2021 9:44 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving  YOUR REF: SKV7129X & SMC2082E 

along Upper Bukit Timah Road on 08/12/2020 - Oref: 20/20/20/VP05/023993 [External 
Confidential] *** LKK REF : CC4/LPC20013707/Qga3

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
 
 
Dear Cecilia  
 
Please proceed as per your recommendations.  
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Kenny Lim  
Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
In view of the latest “Heightened Alert” on COVID-19 measures, more than 
50% of our staff will be working from home from 17 May to 13 June 2021. 
Please expect delays in our replies during this period. Your understanding is 
greatly appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 20 April 2021 11:41 am 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; KENNY LIM CHING GHEE 
<kennylim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: New Assignment (PRS) - Accident involving YOUR REF: SKV7129X & SMC2082E along 
Upper Bukit Timah Road on 08/12/2020 - Oref: 20/20/20/VP05/023993 [External Confidential] *** LKK 
REF : CC4/LPC20013707/Qga3 
 

Lonpac Ref: 20/20/20/VP05/023993 
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LKK Ref: CC4/LPC20013707/Qga3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have highlighted to your good office on 20/12/2020 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with 
our Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

This is a chain collision(OI second). Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “MY CAR CONSULTANT PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 11,266.33 $ 2,300.50 
2. Loss of Use (3days x $150.00) $      450.00 $    180.00 (3days x $60.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $        36.49 $       7.45 

Total $ 11,752.82 $ 2,487.95 

  

**03days recommendation for repair 

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

  

The above is for your approval. 

 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 




