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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Serene LIM <serene@autocare.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 11:52 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: S0M02YEM_TP REF:GBH1862G _Accident Involving FBQ9242X & 

GBH1862G_along_Guillemard Road on 04/12/2020 18:00_PersonalAutoLine
Attachments: Authorisation To Act.pdf; Final Bill $2150.pdf; LTA receipt-20201207-163459.pdf

Hi Cecilia 
 
We are quantifying the following 
 
Repair Cost $2150 
Loss of use at $80 per day x 4 day $320 
LTA $7.45 
Total : $2,477.45 
 
Attached supporting documents, please revert asap. 
 
 
 
Serene LIM 
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co 
Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 I Hp: +65 96852332 
E-mail: serene@autocare.com.sg 
 
 
 
 
From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 17 February 2021 6:02 pm 
To: Serene LIM <serene@autocare.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: S0M02YEM_TP REF:GBH1862G _Accident Involving FBQ9242X & GBH1862G_along_Guillemard Road on 
04/12/2020 18:00_PersonalAutoLine 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Serence, 
 
We are still pending for PIR from your end as well as from OI.  
 
We will only able to review the matter once we receive the PIR.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 





17.05.22

4,437.56





Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 07 Dec 2020 / 16:34:59

Receipt Date/Time : 07 Dec 2020 / 16:34:44

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-201207-003115

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - FBQ9242X
As at 04 Dec 2020/18:00:00
Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enquiry - FBQ9242X
Enquiry Fee 
20201207163340414767

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

540188XXXXXX1125 eNETS Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.



1

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 16:29
To: AZNYAZWANY@GMAIL.COM
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBQ 9242X AND GBH 1862G ALONG TANJONG KATONG ROAD 

ON 04/12/2020

26 April 2022 
 
MOHAMAD AZNY AZWANY BIN MOHAMAD SHAH 
 
Dear Sir/ Mdm 
 
OUR REF              : CC4/ASM20013699/Kea3 
YOUR REF            : FBQ 9242X 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBQ 9242X AND GBH 1862G ALONG TANJONG KATONG ROAD ON 04/12/2020 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.  
 
We have received a claim from M/s LIM YEW BOO SPRAY PAINT CO acting on behalf of the owner of GBH 1862G against 
your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the opinion that liability may be equally shared between 
both parties due to conflicting versions without any concrete evidences to support each version. 
 
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy. 
 
We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under 
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) 
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this 
letter.  Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.  
 
 
Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to ashersng@lkkauto.com 
within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and 
further document may be required: 
 

 Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any) 
 Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any) 
 Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any) 
 Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any) 
 Video footage of accident (if any) 
 Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any) 
 If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us 

informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim 
 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior knowledge and consent.  
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This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.  
 
In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   
 
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at ashersng@lkkauto.com.  
 
Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively. 
 
 
Yours sincerely 
 
 
 
Asher Sng 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 6051 
Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c.         AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (AXA) 
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
                 
 
 



1

Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 11 May 2022 13:12
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: New message for service request 190720, vehicle number GBH1862G

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

10/5/22 10:09 PM *** Hi Asher, Please proceed as per your mandate. -  TEO Kitty 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: kitty.teo@axa.com.sg <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 10 May 2022 10:10 PM 
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com 
Subject: New message for service request 190720, vehicle number GBH1862G 
 
AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S0M02YEM. 
Please click here https://vendor.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/ClaimApplication/dist/html/index-vendor.html to view the 
message in Vendor Portal. 
 
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a 
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is 
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 
 


