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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Serene LIM <serene@autocare.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 15 March 2021 11:52 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: S0M02YEM_TP REF:GBH1862G _Accident Involving FBQ9242X & 

GBH1862G_along_Guillemard Road on 04/12/2020 18:00_PersonalAutoLine
Attachments: Authorisation To Act.pdf; Final Bill $2150.pdf; LTA receipt-20201207-163459.pdf

Hi Cecilia 
 
We are quantifying the following 
 
Repair Cost $2150 
Loss of use at $80 per day x 4 day $320 
LTA $7.45 
Total : $2,477.45 
 
Attached supporting documents, please revert asap. 
 
 
 
Serene LIM 
Lim Yew Boo Spray Paint Co 
Tel: +65 64545011 | Fax: +65 64593724 I Hp: +65 96852332 
E-mail: serene@autocare.com.sg 
 
 
 
 
From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 17 February 2021 6:02 pm 
To: Serene LIM <serene@autocare.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: S0M02YEM_TP REF:GBH1862G _Accident Involving FBQ9242X & GBH1862G_along_Guillemard Road on 
04/12/2020 18:00_PersonalAutoLine 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Serence, 
 
We are still pending for PIR from your end as well as from OI.  
 
We will only able to review the matter once we receive the PIR.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 


