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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 16 July 2021 11:30 AM

To: alicechau@kanfs.net

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SDQ407Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-39)

Dear Alice, 
  
Finalize COR $6872.65 before GST @ 5 days. 
COR subject to insurance approval. 
  
Regards, 
Guo Qiang 
 

 

From: alicechau [mailto:alicechau@kanfs.net]  
Sent: Wednesday, 14 July, 2021 10:29 AM 

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) 
Cc: SUR 

Subject: Fw: SDQ407Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-39) 

 
Dear Sir, 
 
We refer to the email dated 14/4/2021. 
 
Please confirm and finalise. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
Regards, 
Alice 
Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop 
Tel:6747 9560 
Fax:6748 1006 

 
---------- Forwarded Message ----------- 
From:"alicechau" <alicechau@kanfs.net> 
To:"Guo Qiang (LKK)" <guoqiang@lkkauto.com> 
Cc:"Survey (LKK AUTO)" <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Sent:Wed, 14 Apr 2021 14:11:54 +0800 
Subject:SDQ407Z (OD) - Finalization & photo (1-39) 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
With reference to the mentioned vehicle, kindly confirm and finalise. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
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Alice 
Kan Fook Sing Motor Workshop 
Tel:6747 9560 
Fax:6748 1006 
 
------- End of Forwarded Message ------- 


