9/7/21, 1:37 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SKM4772S HONDA JAZZ----------- FINALIZE

Claims <claims@rico60.com>
Tue 7/9/2021 1:36 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

hi taufikh ,

accept and closed ....

On Sep 7, 2021 at 1:30 PM, <Denise Tay (LKKAuto)> wrote:

HI Xiong,
Can confirm?

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 1 September 2021 11:03 pm

To: 'Rico 60 Claims' <claims@rico60.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKM4772S HONDA JAZZ----------- FINALIZE

Hi Xiong,
Refer attached, COR I/s $7600, 7 days.
Subject to insurance approval

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Rico 60 Claims [mailto:claims@rico60.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 1 September 2021 8:55 AM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto); Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Catherine
Chong (LKK Auto); Veron Chen (LKKAuto); celinefong@Ikkauto.com

Cc: Rico 60 Enquiry

Subject: Re: SKM4772S HONDA JAZZ----------- FINALIZE
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9/7/21, 1:37 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook
hi Taufikh,

attached wheel report

KINDLY FINALIZE ASAP

Regards,
XIONG

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier (@ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com

On Thu, Aug 5, 2021 at 12:22 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@]lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi,

Can forward the wheel alignment report?
Thank you.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Rico 60 Claims [mailto:claims@rico60.com]
Sent: Friday, 25 December 2020 6:59 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: Rico 60 Enquiry

Subject: Re: SKM4772S HONDA JAZZ----------- FINALIZE

Taufikh,
Kindly assist us to finalize this case.
Adrian already take check item photos....

Attached marking estimate And after paint for your reference

Regards,xiong
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RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com

On Sun, Dec 13, 2020 at 5:15 PM Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com> wrote:

Taufikh......ovveeeenne....

Vehicle No. SKM4779S
Date of 10/12/2020
Inspection

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.
Adrian already take check item photos....
Attached marking estimate for your reference
vehicle still under repair ....

after repair photos will be sent to you soon..

Regards, XIONG

l |

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier (@ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com
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