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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Dave Ho <dave@keeyongauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 7 June 2021 7:14 pm

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINALISE OF SKB 2771B

Hi Shiau, 

 

The offer is confirmed at $5,300.00. Please arrange the discharge voucher.  

Thanks and Regards, 

 

 

Dave Ho  

 

 

KEE YONG AUTOMOBILE SERVICE 

160 Sin Ming Drive, #03-09 Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722 

 

 

 

Tel: (65) 6453 2605 |  Mobile: (65) 97107372 | Fax: (65) 6453 3790 |  

*dave@keeyongauto.com.sg | : www.keeyongauto.com.sg 

 

 

On 7 Jun 2021, at 5:04 PM, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

Dear Dave, 

  

Can confirm the repair cost? 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 31 May 2021 3:23 pm 

To: admin@keeyongauto.com.sg; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FINALISE OF SKB 2771B 

  

Dear Dave, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Offer Lump Sum $5,300.00 and 6 repair days. 
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Kindly check and confirm. 

  

If you have any enquiry, please contact our surveyor, Kenneth at 96910663. 

  

Dear Kenneth, 

  

Kee Yong Auto, Dave contact no. : 97107372 

  
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


