Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 December 2020 5:07 PM

To: service@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: simon@kkimhin.com.sg; Sandra (Gmail); survey@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: RE: XD 66348 / OD / LPC

Dear Sir,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle XD 6634B (Excess $1500/-). NOT EXCEEDING
$26,000/- WHICH EVER LOWER ON LUMP SUM

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to
arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

*Please arrange kenneth to have photo taking for check item and other necessary photograph.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: service <service@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 December 2020 11:59 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: simon@kkimhin.com.sg; Sandra (Gmail) <sandrakhong@gmail.com>; survey@kkimhin.com.sg
Subject: re: XD 6634B / OD / LPC

Dear Denise
Good day to you.
We need lumpsum $26k to repair this vehicle.

Best Regards

Sandra

6452 7018

9622 2116

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From: "Denise Tay (LKKAuto)" <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 8:57 AM




To: "service@kkimhin.com.sg" <service@kkimhin.com.sg>, "Simon" <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>,
"sandrakhong@gmail.com" <sandrakhong@gmail.com>, "survey@kkimhin.com.sg" <survey@kkimhin.com.sg>
Subject: XD 6634B / OD / LPC

Dear Sir/Madam,

Vehicle was survey was by Kenneth yesterday. He would like to know how much will you need to repair this vehicle.

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



