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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 April 2021 4:38 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048  SHC5895R  04.12.20

Attachments: image007.emz

Hi Shiau Chan 

 

Amount confirmed $9,300.00 (before GST). 

 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the 

conduconduconduconduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.ct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.ct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.ct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, 5 April, 2021 2:35 PM 

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Dear Wai Yin, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Offer Lump Sum $9,300.00 before GST and 14 repair days. 

 

Kindly check. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 1 April 2021 3:23 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 



2

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Without prejudice 

 

Dear Shiau Chan 

 

NBV : $32,711.41 
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Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the 

conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 
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From: Wei Chun Kong  

Sent: Thursday, 1 April, 2021 2:35 PM 

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Hi Wai Yin, 

 

SHC5895R Vehicle net book value is $32,711.41 breakdown please refer below:- 

 

 

 
 

 

 

 

Thanks 

Best regards 
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CK 

 

 

 
 
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng  

Sent: Wednesday, 31 March, 2021 11:51 AM 

To: Wei Chun Kong <weichunkong@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Hi CK 

 

Below requested for the NBV with breakdown. 

 

 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 31 March, 2021 11:44 AM 

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Dear Wai Yin, 

 

Kindly provide us the Book Value & LTA rebate of above vehicle. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 10:42 AM 

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Dear Kenneth, 

 

FYNA. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111 

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666   Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764  

Website: www.transcab.com.sg 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 26 March 2021 9:12 AM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Without prejudice 

 

Dear Shiau Chan 

 

Yes, repair done on 28/12/2020. 

 

Enclosed is after paint photos for your action. 

 

Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the 

conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 25 March, 2021 6:00 PM 

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Dear Wai Yin, 

 

Kindly advise the vehicle has been repaired? This repair cost have limit. 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 10:56 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 

Subject: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-048 SHC5895R 04.12.20 

 

Without prejudice 

 

Dear Sir 

 

We would like to finalize for the above case. 

 

We propose COR amount at $12,350.00 (before GST). 

 

Kindly check and revert to confirm the amount. 
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Thank You 

Best Regards, 

Ng Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai YinNg Wai Yin    

Finance Department 

TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 

 

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 

* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the * Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the 

conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.    

 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 

Singapore 569111 

Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764 

 

 


