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MUTUAL SETTLEMENT FORM
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. WE, THE UNDERSIGNED HEREBY AGREE TO MUTUALLY SETTLE AMONG OURSELVES A MOTCOR ACCIDENT

FOR MOTOR ACCIDENT
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[AIG

AS FOLLOWS:

Date / Time:

| Along:

Involving Vehicle Number(s):

23/11/2020 15.05
KRANJI LOOP

&
SMB 1411B & SJL28P

2. BOTH PARTIES HAVE AGREED TO SETTLE THIS MATTER AMICABLY AS FOLLOWS:

*Delata {A) and [B) us applicable.

be incurred as a result of the accident.

(B) Without admission of liability, TJANG MEI YEAN

(A) Neither party shall be liable to compensate the party for any loss or damages (direct or indirect) incurred or to

paid a sum of §$ 4,65700 /

{Name) (Party paying compensation) has
(Amount) which SMRT BUSES LTD ‘

(Owner

costs incurred as a result of this accident.

Signafurem
y,

Name: m Q—l- BUSES CTD
I/C No: (qBLDZM}.O
Address:

Vehicle No.: SMB 1411B

Confact No.:

b5TL 3522

0. 03 2oh

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building 78 Shenton Way #07-14 Singapore 079120
Tel: 6419 3000

Co. Reg. No, 201009404M

of vehicle receiving compensation) herewith acknowledge receipt in full and final settiement of damages and

‘ Slqncﬂure W
|

[ Name: Tang Mei Yean
—— N
/ENe: 579700024
| _ |
| Address: [

| 2 Sembawang Walk #01-18 S757616

| Vehicle No.: SJL 28P

Contact No.: 98792262

| Date: 08.02.2021

Copyright © 2015 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. All rights reserved.



Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 29 April 2021 2:33 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: 3178449338SG

Dear Jasper,

Kindly submit DAR for closure.

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Advanced Leave Notification:

Saliha Syed Yusoff (Ms)
Senior Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1917

saliha.syed-yusoff @aig.com | www.AIG.sg

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, April 21, 2021 3:58 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff@aig.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 3178449338SG

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Hi Saliha,

MS form and LKK uploaded in Merimen.



Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 April 2021 1:57 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff @aig.com>
Subject: 3178449338SG

Hi Saliha,
We refer to the matter below.

Kindly assist to contact Jonathan Lim (+65 6535 1828) from AVA Insurance Brokers Pte Ltd which
represent the OI handling the case.

He wish to talk to you on the survey fee incurred.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha <Saliha.Syed-Yusoff @aig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 February 2021 2:33 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 3178449338SG

Dear Jasper,

Kindly explain to Ol that without LKK’s involvement/adjustment, the COR will be as per estimate and to preserve
NCD, there should not be any payout under the policy.

Kind Regards,
Saliha

Advanced Leave Notification:

Saliha Syed Yusoff (Ms)
Senior Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building
78 Shenton Way, Level 10
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