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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 3:30 PM
To: David Ang
Cc: Admin A; G S Lim & Partners
Subject: RE: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 04/12/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKW 8906 H) & AIG 

INSURED (SKT 1535 G) ALONG HOUGANG ST. 21, BLK 210 OPEN CAR PARK LKK 
REF : CC6/AIG20013396/Ups3

Attachments: DV_SKW8906H.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We confirm settlement as follows: - 
 

1. Cost of Repair  $ 4,000.00 
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $100.00) $    500.00 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

Total  $ 4,502.00 
 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us for our necessary action. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 1:38 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; G S Lim & Partners <gslimlaw@singnet.com.sg> 
Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 04/12/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKW 8906 H) & AIG INSURED (SKT 1535 G) ALONG 
HOUGANG ST. 21, BLK 210 OPEN CAR PARK LKK REF : CC6/AIG20013396/Ups3 
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Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Upon today, the due date, we still not receive your reply for the above claims full settlement, Kindly 
revert & confirm, failing, client's solicitors will be handle the claims, they will no more further notice to 
yours, 
 
On Sat, 26 Dec 2020 at 12:35, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Thanks for your email, we are unable to accept your offer of car rental only $ 400.00 As 06/12/2020 
was Sunday, Not a working day. Please reconsider our car rental at $ 500.00  
 
Failing, client's will hand over his case to his appointed solicitors, Beyond our control, due to client's 
not happy, as i just noticed him to top up the car rental to us. Please let us have your reply by next 
(7) days. 
 
On Sat, 26 Dec 2020 at 12:16, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We propose settlement as follows: -  
   

1. Cost of Repair  $ 4,000.00 
2. Loss of Rental (4days x $100.00) $    400.00 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $        2.00 

Total  $ 4,402.00 
   
Please confirm acceptance.  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 4:04 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 04/12/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKW 8906 H) & AIG INSURED (SKT 1535 G) 
ALONG HOUGANG ST. 21, BLK 210 OPEN CAR PARK LKK REF : CC6/AIG20013396/Ups3  
  
Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
Upon today, we still have not received your DV for direct settlement, PLease revert. 
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Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Thu, 10 Dec 2020 at 14:21, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We attach our letter of demand, final bill, car rental bill, receipt, third party insurer search & owner 
authorisation letter for your reference & attention, 
 
We will forward the original documents to you by mail, Please let us have the full settlement 
soonest. 
 
On Tue, 8 Dec 2020 at 11:17, David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com> wrote: 

Noted, will do.  
 

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Tue, 8 Dec 2020 at 10:50, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter.   

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / 
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) for the above mentioned case. 

  

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental 
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 

  

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: David Ang <hupmotor@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 7 December 2020 12:33 PM 
To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 04/12/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKW 8906 H) & AIG INSURED (SKT 1535 G) 
ALONG HOUGANG ST. 21, BLK 210 OPEN CAR PARK LKK REF : CC6/AIG20013396/Ups3 

  

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

  

Kindly revert & confirm the client's third party claims liability & direct settlement, 

  

For your information, we had phone record for the composition between your insured driver & us. 

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Mon, 7 Dec 2020 at 11:36, Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs / Madam, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 

  

 

  

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong via email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
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* Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

                                                                

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li | Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 1467 Email: SuLi@lkkauto.com| Fax : 6271 8802 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Branch : Blk 1007, Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-11 | S(159721) 

  

From: David Ang [mailto:hupmotor@gmail.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 5 December 2020 12:52 PM 
To: SUR 
Cc: Admin A; Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 04/12/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SKW 8906 H) & AIG INSURED (SKT 1535 G) 
ALONG HOUGANG ST. 21, BLK 210 OPEN CAR PARK 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Attach our estimate bill, Third party insurer search, client's GIA report, insurance certificate & log 
card for your reference & attention, Kindly revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, 
reference & OIC, as we are looking for direct settlement. 

  

We had assign your in-house surveyor (Mr Marcus Chua) to survey client's damaged vehicle, we 
also attach the accident screen photo to yours, to show & proof the third party (AIG insured) was 
moving out from the parking lot & his view was block by the parked van on his left side, as the 
result, his car front portion hit on to our insured (driving straight ahead) right side portion.. 

  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  
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Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

 
 

  

--  

Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 

Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 
 
--  
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 
 
--  
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 
 
--  
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 
 
--  
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Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  

 
 
 
--  
Best Regards 
David Ang 

Tel : 6784 0039,  Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655 
Mailing Address : 
Hup Motor Trading & Service  
Blk 9004 Tampines St 93 
#01-120 
Singapore 528838  


