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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 December 2020 1:10 PM

To: Zuraimee Bin Mantau

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); SUR; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Request MV for YN1694X, MT/1109564-001

Dear Zuraimee, 

 

The market value for YN 1694X is $33K - $35k(est) as at Nov 2020 

 
 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Zuraimee Bin Mantau <zuraimee.mantau@income.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 4 December 2020 12:09 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) 

<siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Request MV for YN1694X, MT/1109564-001 

Importance: High 

 

Dear LKK 

 

Please help on the market value. 

 

 

Vehicle Details 

Vehicle No.  

YN1694X  

Vehicle to be Exported  

No  

Intended Deregistration Date  

12 Nov 2020  

Vehicle Make  

MITSUBISHI  

Vehicle Model  

FM65FM1RDEA  
Primary Colour  

White  

Manufacturing Year  
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2010  

Engine No.  

6M60145770  

Chassis No.  

FM65FMA00104  

Maximum Power Output  

-   

Open Market Value  

$74,521.00  

Original Registration Date  

13 Sep 2010  

First Registration Date  

13 Sep 2010  

Transfer Count  

0  

Actual ARF Paid  

$3,727.00  

Intended PARF Rebate Details 

PARF Eligibility  

No  

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date  

-   

PARF Rebate Amount  

$0.00  

Intended COE Rebate Details 

COE Expiry Date  

12 Sep 2025  
COE Category  

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus  

COE Period(Years)  

5  

PQP Paid  

$11,975.00  

COE Rebate Amount  

$11,575.00  

Total Rebate Amount  

$11,575.00  

Message 

Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan 

(if applicable) of the vehicle.  

The information contained herein is correct as at 11 Nov 2020  

 

 

 
Zuraimee Bin Mantau 

Senior Executive 

Operations, Motor & Personal Lines 

T +65 6430 7891 
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Disclaimer 

 

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named 

above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank 

you.  


