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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 14 January 2021 2:37 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Andre Chow En De; Loi Ai Ting; Jojo Cheng; Coco Lu Ting
Subject: Your Ref: CC4/AIG20013300/ba3 (SMK3117R)     Our Ref: SMQ3531X     DOA: 

02/12/2020
Attachments: SMQ3531X - Letter of Demand.pdf

Dear Jasper, 
 
Pls. refer to attached LOD. 
 
Our customer, Low Yong Peow @ Tan Yong Peow insured with AIG claims as follows. 
 
Cost of Repair                    $ 4,086.54 
Loss of Rental                    $    535.00   ($107.00  x 5 days) 
                                                -------------- 
Total                                      $ 4,621.54 
 
Appreciate if you could quantify your offer of settlement the soonest. 
 
Thank you so much. 
 
 
Best regards, 
 
Larry Songcuan 
Customer Service 
 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4658  •  F: +65 6565 1240 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 
 

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 13 January 2021 10:05 AM 
To: Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Loi 
Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting 
<coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SMQ3531X (KIA) - FINALIZE TP CLAIM (AIG) 
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Without Prejudice 














	Microsoft Outlook - Memo Style
	55f06baeb612ecac77ebdf35210ebad8c3df1d1e6df9e38c3cb741c84e39bc85.pdf
	55f06baeb612ecac77ebdf35210ebad8c3df1d1e6df9e38c3cb741c84e39bc85.pdf

