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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 February 2021 4:40 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref : D20004898MFSH / Your Ref : SLX3333B / Accident Involving SHC8607L, 

SLX3333B and SLZ5571G on 01/12/20.

Dear Jaslin, 

 
Pls offer as per below : 

 
COR - $7,061.83 
LOR - $720.00 to $1,120.00 ($120 to $140 x 6 to 8 days) 
LTA - $7.45 
TOTAL - $7,789.28 to $8,189.28 

 
Regards 
 

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No.

195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 

whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 

error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Thursday, 18 February 2021 4:04 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Our Ref : D20004898MFSH / Your Ref : SLX3333B / Accident Involving SHC8607L, SLX3333B and 

SLZ5571G on 01/12/20. 

 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 8607L (FCI) AND SLX 3333B (TP) ON 01/12/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “MBM WHEELPOWER PTE LTD" at $ 8,610.08 (all-in). 
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The summary is as follows: - 
  

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair  $ 20,495.00 $ 7,061.83 ($6,599.84 + 7% GST) 

2. Loss of Rental (8 days x $180.00)(w/GST) $ 1,540.80 $ 1,540.80 (8 days x $180.00)(w/GST) 

3. LTA / GIA Search Fee $ 7.45 $ 7.45 

Total $ 11,008.45 $ 8,610.08 

 

Surveyor recommended 6 days for repair + 1 PRS + 1 Sunday = 8 days 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From:

From:From:

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Thursday, 18 February, 2021 3:47 PM 

To:

To:To:

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Our Ref : D20004898MFSH / Your Ref : SLX3333B / Accident Involving SHC8607L, SLX3333B and 

SLZ5571G on 01/12/20. 

 

Dear Asher, 

 
Kindly refer to my email below. 

 
Have you reply back to TP to hold on? 

 
Pls put up mandate offer for approval as TP just send another reminder today asking for offer. 

 
Regards 
 

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 

195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
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Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 

whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 

error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris)  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 11:16 am 

To:

To:To:

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Our Ref : D20004898MFSH / Your Ref : SLX3333B / Accident Involving SHC8607L, SLX3333B and 

SLZ5571G on 01/12/20. 

 

Dear Asher, 

 
TP is chasing for offer. 

 
Kindly revert back to TP on the below email & put up mandate offer for approval. 

 
Thank you. 
 

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 

195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 

whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 

error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: ivy.lwi@mbmwheelpower.com.sg <ivy.lwi@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Tuesday, 26 January 2021 11:14 am 

To:

To:To:

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: RE: Our Ref : D20004898MFSH / Your Ref : SLX3333B / Accident Involving SHC8607L, SLX3333B and 

SLZ5571G on 01/12/20. 

 

Dear Chris, 

Any updates for the above mentioned case. 

Your kind assistance is much appreciate . 

Thank you. 

Best regards, 
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Ivy Lwi  

Claims Department 

 

T 6262 8888 | F 6250 9015 | M 8588 3198 

Email: ivy.lwi@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 

Sin Ming AutoCity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

 

From:

From:From:

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 10:17 AM 

To:

To:To:

To: ivy.lwi@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: Our Ref : D20004898MFSH / Your Ref : SLX3333B / Accident Involving SHC8607L, SLX3333B and SLZ5571G 

on 01/12/20. 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

 

We acknowledge receipt of your LOD dated 06 Jan 2021, received by us on 06 Jan 2021.  

 

We are investigating into the matter and will revert back to you in due course.  

 

Regards  

 

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 

195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

 

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please 

refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

 

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the 

addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have 

received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 

sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: ivy.lwi@mbmwheelpower.com.sg <ivy.lwi@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 4:58 pm 

To:

To:To:

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
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Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: LOD - D20004898MFSH / FW: Accident Involving SLX3333B, SHC8607L and SLZ5571G along CTE towards 

Orchard on 01/12/2020 at 10:40hrs 

 

Your ref: SHC8607L 

Our Ref : SLX3333B / WIP 32586 

 

Dear Chris, 

 

We would like to append our losses from you. 

  

As the insurer of your insured driver’s negligence driving for the above accident. 

  

Enclosed herewith the scan copy of our letter of demand and supporting documents for your 

perusal. 

  

Kindly look into the matter and revert the claim settlement to us as soon as possible. 

  

To expedite this claim, please reply to us by email. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Ivy Lwi | Claims Department 

 

T 6262 8888 | F 6250 9015 | M 8588 3198 

Email: ivy.lwi@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 
MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 
Sin Ming AutoCity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 
 

From:

From:From:

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  

S

SS

Sent:

ent:ent:

ent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 11:43 AM 

To:

To:To:

To: shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: Our Ref : D20004898MFSH / FW: Accident Involving SLX3333B, SHC8607L and SLZ5571G along CTE towards 

Orchard on 01/12/2020 at 10:40hrs 

 

Dear Shirley, 
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Liability is clear for this case. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Chris Lim 

Motor Claims Dept. 

  

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  

| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No. 

195000106C  

A Member of  Insurance Group 

  

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 

MailScanner has detected a possible fraud attempt from "apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com" claiming to be 

http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 

  

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 

whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 

error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 

 

From:

From:From:

From: shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg <shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 11:30 am 

To:

To:To:

To: Mary Nelson <marynelson@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Novin Siah <NovinSiah@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 

Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SLX3333B, SHC8607L and SLZ5571G along CTE towards Orchard on 01/12/2020 at 

10:40hrs 

 

 

Dear All, 

 

Kindly help to response to the below loss. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Lee Shirley | Claims Advisor 

 

 
T

TT

T 6262 8888 | F

FF

F 6250 9015 | M

MM

M 8686 5188 
Email: shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.

MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.

MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD. 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 

Sin Ming Autocity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

 

From:

From:From:

From: shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg <shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>  

Sent:

Sent:Sent:

Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 9:19 AM 

To:

To:To:

To: 'motor_claims@first-insurance.com.sg' <motor_claims@first-insurance.com.sg> 

Cc:

Cc:Cc:

Cc: 'gary.wong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg' <gary.wong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>; 'Danny Ong ' 

<danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg> 
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Subject:

Subject:Subject:

Subject: Accident Involving SLX3333B, SHC8607L and SLZ5571G along CTE towards Orchard on 01/12/2020 at 

10:40hrs 

 

 

Dear All 

 

Appreciate if you can advise us on the liability statusAppreciate if you can advise us on the liability statusAppreciate if you can advise us on the liability statusAppreciate if you can advise us on the liability status for the below loss and do not
do notdo not

do not 

arrange for survey. 

 

Kindly refer to the attached GIA report. 

 

Our Client’s Vehicle Number:  SLX3333B 

First Capital Vehicle Number:  SHC8607L 

Date/Time of Loss:  01/12/2020 10:40hrs   

 
 

Please contact Lee Shirley @ 8686 5188 for the survey arrangement 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Lee Shirley | Claims Advisor 

 

 
T

TT

T 6262 8888 | F

FF

F 6250 9015 | M

MM

M 8686 5188 
Email: shirley.lee@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.

MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD.

MBM Wheelpower PTE. LTD. 

160 Sin Ming Drive • #06-02 

Sin Ming Autocity • Singapore 575722 

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

 

 

--  

This message has been scanned for viruses and dangerous content by  

QUAPE SPAM Protection, and is believed to be clean.  

 

--  

This message has been scanned for viruses and dangerous content by  

QUAPE SPAM Protection, and is believed to be clean.  
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