Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Monday, 17 May 2021 11:58 AM

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

Admin A

RE: (Offer Acceptance) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27
NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

DS FORM_PC7199).pdf

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client authorization to act to us (LKK) for our

necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 2:58 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Offer Acceptance) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR

DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury
Claims)



Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We are pleased to inform you that we will accept your kind offer. Kindly note that this settlement is purely
for our client’s property damage component only and without prejudice to any personal injury claims.

Also, could we seek your kindest assistance in forwarding us the Discharge Voucher as soon as possible so
that we can expedite on its return once the client has endorsed it?

Thank you and we hope to hear from you most favourably.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1 June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586
asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 2:24 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Ninth Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.
We have reviewed the matter and we are prepared to improve our offer at a global sum of $5,800.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.



In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 2:16 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Ninth Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and our counter proposal amount.
Our counter proposal was sent via email to you on 15 March 2021.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road



Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Friday, May 7, 2021 1:09 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Eighth Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,



Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and our counter proposal amount.
Our counter proposal was sent via email to you on 15 March 2021.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Sent: Friday, April 30, 2021 3:12 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>




Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: (Seventh Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR

DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and our counter proposal amount.
Our counter proposal was sent via email to you on 15 March 2021.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.



Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 21, 2021 1:31 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Sixth Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and our counter proposal amount.
Our counter proposal was sent via email to you on 15 March 2021.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.



In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 14, 2021 1:41 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Fifth Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE



TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and our counter proposal amount.
Our counter proposal was sent via email to you on 15 March 2021.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

37A Everitt Road



Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, April 5, 2021 2:00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Fourth Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and our counter proposal amount.
Our counter proposal was sent via email to you on 15 March 2021.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586
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Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 25, 2021 2:56 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Third Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,
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Here is a gentle reminder on the abovementioned accident and our counter proposal amount.
Our counter proposal was sent via email to you on 15 March 2021.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, March 15, 2021 4:43 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: (Second Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Hi Hsiao Tong,

We understand your viewpoint that both drivers’ report might not be exactly identical. However, there
seem to be some similarities and consistencies in both drivers’ reports, whereby

1. on both sketch plan by both drivers, our client’s vehicle was on the front of your client’s vehicle,
and

2. the damage on our client’s vehicle is on the rear portion and the damage on your client’s vehicle
should be on the front side (as indicated on your client’s sketch ).

Understanding from this situation whereby our client is on the front and your client was behind us, the
accident could have been a result from your client’s failure to keep a good following distance and/or
travelling too fast, thus being unable to stop in time to avoid an accident.

As such, for the sake of an amicable settlement, we are counter proposing as follows:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) 1 $7,200.00
Cost of Rental :$ 3,060.00
$10,260.00
At 90% : $9,234.00
LTA Search  $ 7.45
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Total: : $9,241.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if

required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

Please be assured that we are only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 12, 2021 4:55 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: (Second Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal. Both parties should
exercise caution as both parties were changing into the same lane.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the
above matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offer at a global sum of $4,100.00(all-in) towards your
client's claim.

Please confirm acceptance.
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 March 2021 2:10 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Second Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

Here is a reminder on the abovementioned accident and call for a direct settlement.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 15t June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:
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37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, March 4, 2021 1:02 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: (Gentle Reminder) ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR
DIRECT SETTLEMENT

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE

TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)
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Dear Sir/Madam,

Here is a gentle reminder on the abovementioned accident and call for a direct settlement.

We sincerely hope that you will be able to revert to us as soon as possible. Please be assured that we are
only seeking an amicable settlement on this matter.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1st June 2019, we have shifted to and are
now operating from the following address:

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new
address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
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From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, February 25, 2021 2:32 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 ) & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Your Ref:

Our Ref : PC 7199 ]

25 February 2021

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Ubi Avenue 1,

#02-25

Singapore 408933

Attn: Claims Department

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - CALL FOR DIRECT
SETTLEMENT

As proposed by our Single Joint Expert, LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD, of Cost of Repair at $7,200, we are
pleased to inform that we are agreeable to the amount proposed.
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As such, we are writing to your kind office to call for a direct settlement, in relation to the accident involving PC 7199
J & SLF 4118 U on 27 November 2020. We will like to know if your company is prepared to settle for the amount as
stated below:

Cost of Repair (amount as proposed by SJE) :$ 7,200.00
Cost of Rental :$ 3,060.00

LTA Search  $ 7.45
Total: : $10,267.45

We seek your kindest assistance in letting us know whether your kind office is agreeable to the above within the next
7 days and we look forward to you forwarding us the DV (without prejudice to any personal injury claims), if
required, so that we can expedite on its return for an amicable settlement to the matter.

We have also attached a copy of our company’s invoice for PC 7199 J, the Singapore Accident Statement of PC
7199], rental invoice and LTA search for your easy reference.

In the meantime, please note that with effect from 1% June 2019, we have shifted to and are now operating
from the following address:

37A Everitt Road
Singapore 428586

Please update your records accordingly and send all future correspondence to the new address above.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586
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asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, December 7, 2020 2:31 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM20013287/Apa3

PROPERTY CLAIM
(WITHOUT PREJUDICE
TO: Any Personal Injury

Claims)

Dear Sir/Madam,

As requested in our prior tele-conversation, attached is the report of PC 7199 J

Thank you.

Regards,

Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd

37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, December 7, 2020 2:11 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM20013287/Apa3

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.

Please provide us the following.

e evidence i.e. video and scene photo.
PIR result (if any)

o Estimated cost of repair

GIA / police report
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 December, 2020 2:35 PM

To: do not reply <donotreply@axa.com.sg>; customer.service@axa.com.sg; SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor
Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>

Cc: filenet-ctom-p-sg <filenet-ctom-p-sg@axa.com.hk>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT

Your Ref:

Our Ref: PC 7199 ]

2 December 2020

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

Attn: Claims Department Via Email

Dear Sir/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020 - APPOINTMENT OF LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD AS SINGLE JOINT EXPERT
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Thank you so much for your reply dated 2 December 2020. We are pleased to inform you that we are agreeable
to your selection of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as the Single Joint Expert.

In compliance with the New State Courts Practice Directions, we shall await your kind office to instruct LKK Auto
Consultants Pte Ltd (as the Single Joint Expert) to attend to the pre-repair survey of our client's damaged vehicle
at our premise at 15 Kaki Bukit Road 4 #01-05/53 Bartley Biz Centre Singapore 417808.

We seek your assistance in arranging for the pre-repair survey by 4 December 2020 (Friday), 1500H so that we
can commence repair on our client's damaged vehicle as soon as possible and expedite the return of the vehicle to
our client.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

From: do not reply <donotreply@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, December 2, 2020 2:28 PM

To: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd <asiamotorsports@hotmail.com>

Cc: filenet-ctom-p-sg <filenet-ctom-p-sg@axa.com.hk>

Subject: SOMO02Y3E_TP REF: _Accident Involving SLF4118U & PC7199J_along_Sembawang Road on
24/11/2020_PersonalAutoLine

WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Please do not reply to this email as we are not able to respond to messages sent to this email. We seek your
cooperation to send all replies to motor.survey@axa.com.sg

Dear Sir,
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We want to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list below to conduct the joint pre-
repair survey as a Single Joint Expert.

List of our motor surveyors:
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
Priority Services Pte Ltd
AXA in house surveyor

Bl Bl N R

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a
single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey
carried out by the single joint expert. Meanwhile, please furnish us with estimate quotation in order for our surveyor to
complete the pre repair survey.

If there be any injury claims by your client, please combine it in one Letter of Demand in light of one cause of action, save as
to costs and expenses.

Should you have any other queries, please feel free to contact our Claims Service Team at 1800-8804888.

Regards,
Shekhar Batham

AXA Singapore

From: Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd [mailto:asiamotorsports@hotmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, December 02, 2020 1:09 PM

To: customer.service@axa.com.sg; SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey@axa.com.sg>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER 2020

Your Ref:

Our Ref: PC 7199 J

2 December 2020

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd PROPERTY CLAIM

8 Shenton Way (WITHOUT PREJUDICE
#27-01 TO: Any Personal Injury
AXA Tower Claims)

Singapore 068811

Attn: Claims Department Via Email
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Dear Sir/Mdm,

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 7199 J & SLF 4118 U ON 27 NOVEMBER
2020

We are instructed to notify you of a road traffic accident on 27 November 2020 at about 1520H at Sembawang
Road involving our client's vehicle registration number PC 7199 J and vehicle registration number SLF 4118
U driven by your insured at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we proceed to repair the
damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice and your proposed
list of 10 recommended motor surveyors for our appointment.

Kindly note that if we do not hear from you by 4 December 2020 (Friday), 1330H, we will be forwarding our
proposed list of 10 motor surveyors for your appointment, in accordance to the new regulations.

Thank you and we hope to hear from you soonest.

Regards,
Asia Motorsports Solution Pte Ltd
37A Everitt Road

Singapore 428586

asiamotorsports@hotmail.com

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Singapore - Externals or any
other entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.
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