Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Operation / Candy Ong <operation@tlauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 12:01 PM

To: SUR; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Before paint photos, supplier's invoices and finalised for SKP4011C
Attachments: 20201211_130934.jpg; 20201211_130939.jpg; 20201211_131018.jpg; 20201211_

131031.,jpg; 20201211_131052.jpg; 20201211_131103.jpg; 20201211_131155.jpg;
20201211_131212,jpg; 20201211_131240.jpg; 20201211_131248.jpg; 20201211_
131255.jpg; 20201211_131300.jpg; 20201211_131306.jpg; 20201211_131308.jpg;
20201211_131314,jpg; 20201211_131317 jpg; 20201211_131319.jpg; 20201211_
131321,jpg; 20201211_131323.jpg; 20201211_131326.jpg; 20201211_131539,jpg;
SKP4011C--Supplier.pdf; SKP4011C---Finalised.pdf

Dear Veron,

As per your request, please find attached for your attention and necessary action
The final total at $ 3,671.10 at 5 working days

Best Regards,
Candy

From: Operation / Candy Ong [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, December 31, 2020 4:12 PM

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Before paint photos, supplier's invoices and finalised for SKP4011C

Dear Kenneth,

Please find attached before paint photos, supplier's invoices for your attention and finalization
Kindly revert.

Best Regards,

Candy Ong
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd



