Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 September 2021 2:18 PM

To: Irene Tay

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SNM17D01981C02/5 (OUR REF: CC3/CTI17006468/Kga3qg2-1) ***

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 899H & SJC 1685H ON 29/03/2017 ***

Dear Irene,
TP inform that they have pass the case to lawyer for handling previously and has been settled.
Thus, we will close the case at our end.

Thanks

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence
should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be
in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
F SRS

RERER WWTT Suve the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 July 2021 3:50 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SNM17D01981C02/5 (OUR REF: CC3/CTI17006468/Kga3g2-1) =+ ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 899H
& SJC 1685H ON 29/03/2017 ***

Dear Mdm,

Please proceed to offer offer Third Party repairer "TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD" at $2,970.39 (all-in).

Regards,

Irene Tay
Executive
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
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