Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 January 2021 3:10 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Claims

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-007 SHC5565T DOA 29.11.20 (ERGO)
Attachments: image006.emz; SHC5565T 29.11.20.pdf

Without prejudice

Dear Shiau Chan
We enclosed is breakdown of the Net Book Value for your attention.

Net Book Value : $25,848.54



Calculation for net book value of Motor vehicle
SHC5565T
Regon 15/8/2014

(M) MV Cost 3,282,335.00
35 % 93,781.00
B) PAFR Value 12,498.00
06 % 7,498.80
c) Depreciation value=A - B
MY Cost § 93,781.00
Less PARF Value § 749880 % 86,282.20
()] Acc depreciate = C*days/2920
Cepreciate value 86,282.20
Days 15/8/2014  28M1/2020 2299 2920
Acc dep*(Valuel/days) 67,932.46
(E) HBV=A-D
- MY Cost § 93781.00
Less-Acc Depreciate $ 6793246 §$ 2584854
Mv cost working
Mv cost 38,953.40
Custom duty 3,999.60
Register fee 140.00
COE 50,088.00
Taxi meter 600.00
93,781.00
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764



From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 28 January, 2021 1:58 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-007 SHC5565T DOA 29.11.20 (ERGO)

Dear Wai Yin,

Can provide us the GIA report of SHC 5565T.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 January 2021 1:24 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-007 SHC5565T DOA 29.11.20 (ERGO)

Without prejudice

Dear Shiau Chan
Net Book Value : $25,848.54

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Wei Chun Kong

Sent: Thursday, 28 January, 2021 10:39 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-007 SHC5565T DOA 29.11.20 (ERGO)

Hi Wai Yin,

SHC5565T NBV is $25,848.54



Thanks
Best regards

CK

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
f"“Cﬂg -

Website: www.transcab.com.sg

This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet.

From: Wai Yin Ng

Sent: Wednesday, 27 January, 2021 9:17 AM

To: Wei Chun Kong <weichunkong@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-007 SHC5565T DOA 29.11.20 (ERGO)

Hi CK

Below request NBV.

Ng Wai Yin

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 January, 2021 9:01 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-007 SHC5565T DOA 29.11.20 (ERGO)

Dear Wai Yin,
According to Kenneth, he is wait for the book value of the above vehicle.

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 January 2021 9:00 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION : AAD2012-007 SHC5565T DOA 29.11.20 (ERGO)

Without prejudice

Dear Shiau Chan

| submitted already. You let me know as soon if got any changed of the COR.
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