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ACCIDENT INVOLVING SME 852C & SHB 2369T ALONG/AT 51 GRANGE ROAD ON
27/11/2020

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Fri 1/29/2021 3:16 PM
To:  noemail@contract.com <noemail@contract.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Our Ref: CC3/CTI20013210/T1ra3q2
	
CHEN	SHUI	XIAN–	BY	EMAIL	ONLY
[POLICY HOLDER]
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
ACCIDENT	INVOLVING	SME	852C	&	SHB	2369T	ALONG/AT	51	GRANGE	ROAD	ON	27/11/2020
	
We refer to the above accident where we are ac�ng for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.
 
We have received a claim from SHB 2369T against your motor insurance policy.
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour as
your vehicle was changing lane and collided with Third Party who was moving in own lane. Vehicles should
keep in proper lane and change lane only when it is safe. We will therefore proceed to nego�ate for an
amicable se�lement with the Third Party.
               
Should you however wish to further discuss on the ma�er prior to our nego�a�ons and se�lement, please
contact us within 7 days from the date of this le�er.
 
Please call us if you have further queries.
 
 
c.c.         China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
            (Motor Claims Dept)

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com


RE: SNM20D204667/C02/SME852C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident
Involving SME852C (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHB2369T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI20013210/T1ra3) on 27/11/2020

Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>
Thu 2/18/2021 2:55 PM
To:  Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc:  Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

[Strictly Confiden�al]
 
 
 
Without Prejudice
 
 
Hi Jaslin
 
Please proceed with your recommendation.
 
 
** Note: Please cc to claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com when you reply to us.
 
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to
be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted
 
Thanks.
 
Pauline Tham
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 6389 6541   |   F: (65) 6224 7175
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.
 
 
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, February 1, 2021 12:16 PM 
To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM20D204667/C02/SME852C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SME852C (OI :
CTI - TBA) and SHB2369T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20013210/T1ra3) on 27/11/2020
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT	INVOLVING	SME852C	(CTI)	AND	SHB2369T	(TP)	ON	27/11/2020
 
We refer to the above matter.

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/


OI changed lane and collided with Third Party who was moving along own lane. Liability is not in our
insured driver’s favour.

We seek your approval to offer repairer “COMFORTDELGRO	ENGINEERING	PTE	LTD"	at $1,695.59
(all-in).
 
The summary is as follows: -
 

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 970.00 $ 888.10 ($830.00 +7%GST)
2. Loss of Rental (06days x $125.19) $ 751.14 $ 600.00 (04days x $125.19)
3. Loss of Income (06days x $80.00) $ 480.00 $ 200.00 (04days x $50.00)
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 7.49 $ 7.49

Total $ 2,208.63 $ 1,695.59
 
Surveyor recommended 2 days for repair + 2 PRS = 4 days
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.
 
	
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 2 January 2021 3:51 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM20D204667/C02/SME852C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SME852C (OI :
CTI - TBA) and SHB2369T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20013210/T1ra3) on 27/11/2020
 
[Strictly Confiden�al]
 
 
Hi Mei Kwan
 
Insured report attached for view.
 
 
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to
be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted
 
Thanks.
 
Pauline Tham
Senior Executive
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 6389 6541   |   F: (65) 6224 7175

mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com
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W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.
 
 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 21, 2020 7:28 PM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM20D204667/C02/SME852C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SME852C (OI :
CTI - TBA) and SHB2369T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20013210/T1ra3) on 27/11/2020
 
Dear Pauline,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
	
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"
	
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 December, 2020 12:49 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)
<jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: O/R: SNM20D204667/C02/SME852C/THAMYL / FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SME852C (OI
: CTI - TBA) and SHB2369T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI20013210/T1ra3) on 27/11/2020
 
Dear all,
 
Please note that officer in charge for this case is Pauline Tham.
 
Claim no. SNM20D204667/C02/SME852C/THAMYL. Kindly note that the previous reference SNM20D204639
is incorrect as 2 accident in 2 day.
 
Dear Pauline,
 
Pls revert LKK.
 
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents
to us as delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should
be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted.
 
Thank you
 
Chong Boon Sen
Claims Department

https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.sg.cntaiping.com%2F&data=04%7C01%7Cpauline.tham%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cd923f835f7c54c6b534c08d8c6682508%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C637477498316663715%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=dWAtR585Hpi%2BJ%2FP2P%2BC8r%2BY0hzkfkeuSrR4W%2BJVEkzY%3D&reserved=0
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China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896116   |   F: (65) 62247175  
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.
 
 
 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 10:34 AM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SME852C (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHB2369T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI20013210/T1ra3) on 27/11/2020
 
Dear Sir/ Madam,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We have inspected TP vehicle SHB 2369T at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:

-                TP GIA report

-                TP estimated cost of repair

-                Preliminary advice
 
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
 
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jaslin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2157.
 
To	check	availability	of	the	case	handler	,	you	may	contact	the	undersigned.
 

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.sg.cntaiping.com%2F&data=04%7C01%7Cpauline.tham%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cd923f835f7c54c6b534c08d8c6682508%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C637477498316673708%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C1000&sdata=JYfx5xZjT3%2BgK3E4zEIt8LmbfbGvxgfKxKUXXbO2%2Bx4%3D&reserved=0
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