Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 December 2020 8:38 AM
To: Alan Chng

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YN7824Z finalization

Dear Alan,

Confirm part by part $7596, 6days

Please submit your relevant document to Lonpac Insurance.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | 5(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 10 December 2020 8:25 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Alan Chng <tuckmeng@mova.com.sg>

Subject: YN7824Z finalization

Hi Denise,

I've already checked the finalize. Kindly assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants



Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: Alan Chng [mailto:tuckmeng@mova.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 4:30 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: YN7824Z finalization

Dear Steve,

Please refer the attach to confirm the COR.
Repair cost $7596
Thanks!

Best Regards

Alan Chng

Claims Estimator

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
H/P 9686 9276

Office No:6262 3377

Fax No:6264 3151



