Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 12:32 PM
To: ‘Muhammad Zuhri'

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBK7247C GIA

Attachments: Finalize.pdf

Hi Zuhri,

COR $5388.80, 5 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Muhammad Zuhri [mailto:zuhri@tanchong.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 16 December 2020 12:30 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBK7247C GIA

Dear Taufikh,
Finalize & check item photo attached.
Before paint photo not available because my mistake miss out to take photo when do the repair process, Sorry.

Best Regards,

ZUHRI

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd

913 Bukit Timah Road

Singapore 589622

Tel: +65-64694091 :: DID: +65-67038916 :: Fax: +65-64697472
Email: zuhri@tanchong.com

Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.nissan.com.sg

From: Muhammad Zubhri

Sent: 02 December 2020 10:07

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBK7247C GIA

Dear Taufikh,

Sorry for the inconvenience ,
Attached.

Best Regards,

ZUHRI

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd

913 Bukit Timah Road
Singapore 589622



Tel: +65-64694091 :: DID: +65-67038916 :: Fax: +65-64697472
Email: zuhri@tanchong.com
Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.nissan.com.sg

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: 01 December 2020 22:29

To: Muhammad Zuhri <zuhri@tanchong.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBK7247C GIA

Hi Zuhri,

Can forward the GIA report for GBK7247C? Given me the wrong GIA during survey for another vehicle GBH2947P.
Regards

Taufikh

LKK AUTO
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