6/15/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Your Ref: GBB566A // LKK Ref: CC4/11120013075/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH
7142K(1l1) AND GBB 566A ON 24/11/2020]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Tue 15/6/2021 10:56 AM

To: CuiPing (Ms Lee) <cuiping@carway.com.sg>

[ﬂJ 1 attachments (592 KB)
DV_GBB566A.pdf;

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CuiPing (Ms Lee) <cuiping@carway.com.sg>

Sent: Sunday, 13 June 2021 5:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBB566A // LKK Ref: CC4/11120013075/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7142K(l1l) AND
GBB 566A ON 24/11/2020]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Offer accepted. Please proceed to close the case.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
¢ CuiPing (Ms Lee) ¢

www.carway.com.sg
Office: (+65) 6744 0777 | Fax: (+65) 6744 2377 | Mobile: (+65) 8588 0777
Main Office Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpPF%... 1/6
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Showroom Address: 61 Ubi Avenue 2 #05-09 Automobile Megamart, Singapore 408898
Workshop Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Disclaimer: This e-mail may contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of
recipient(s) named herein. If you have received this message in error, please delete all copies of it and notify us
immediately.

On 2021-05-14 14:39, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $3,150.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on

the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CuiPing (Ms Lee) <cuiping@carway.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 11:36 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBB566A // LKK Ref: CC4/11120013075/Aps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7142K(l1I) AND
GBB 566A ON 24/11/2020]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Sorry for the late response.
Attached herewith the documents for the necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
¢ CuiPing (Ms Lee) ¢

=

WWwWWw.Carway.Ccom.sg
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Office: (+65) 6744 0777 | Fax: (+65) 6744 2377 | Mobile: (+65) 8588 0777
Main Office Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Showroom Address: 61 Ubi Avenue 2 #05-09 Automobile Megamart, Singapore 408898
Workshop Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Disclaimer: This e-mail may contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of
recipient(s) named herein. If you have received this message in error, please delete all copies of it and notify us
immediately.

On 2021-04-30 16:41, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
2"d REMINDER Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.
For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $2,700.00(before GST) with 04 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to
act, rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without
prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties
resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party
that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not
bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 March 2021 1:49 PM

To: CuiPing (Ms Lee) <cuiping@carway.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Re: Your Ref: GBB566A // LKK Ref: CC4/11120013075/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SH 7142K(III) AND GBB 566A ON 24/11/2020]

REMINDER Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $2,700.00(before GST) with 04 repair days.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WE2MfQpF %. ..
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Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to
act, rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without
prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties
resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party
that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not
bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 February 2021 8:35 AM

To: CuiPing (Ms Lee) <cuiping@carway.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Re: Your Ref: GBB566A // LKK Ref: CC4/11120013075/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SH 7142K(III) AND GBB 566A ON 24/11/2020]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

For COR, recommended amount at L/sum $2,700.00(before GST) with 04 repair days.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to
act, rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without
prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties
resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /

inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party
that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not
bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: CuiPing (Ms Lee) <cuiping@carway.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 January 2021 11:26 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: Re: Your Ref: GBB566A // LKK Ref: CC4/11120013075/Aps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SH 7142K(III) AND GBB 566A ON 24/11/2020]

Dear Ms Hsiao Tong,

Attached herewith the only scene photos provided by Driver.

Third Party's GIA Report has clearly illustrated that Our client's vehicle is travelling_straight
and at the right of way. We seriously of the opinion that Taxi driver to prove that my client's
vehicle from the right of way to have collided onto him.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
4 CuiPing (Ms Lee) ¢

www.carway.com.sg
Office: (+65) 6744 0777 | Fax: (+65) 6744 2377 | Mobile: (+65) 8588 0777
Main Office Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Showroom Address: 61 Ubi Avenue 2 #05-09 Automobile Megamart, Singapore 408898
Workshop Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Disclaimer: This e-mail may contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of
recipient(s) named herein. If you have received this message in error, please delete all copies of it and notify us
immediately.

On 2020-12-30 16:47, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:

Your Ref: GBB566A Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC4/11120013075/Aps3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 7142K(Il1) AND GBB 566A ON 24/11/2020

We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per III instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene
photos / PIR) for our necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.
"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole

intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence
on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement."

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)
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