Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 January 2021 3:40 PM

To: Operation / Candy Ong

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Before paint photos and finalised for GBH7542R
Dear Candy,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm final fig $5,800.60 before excess $1,400.00 & GST and 5 repair days.
Kindly expedite the discharge voucher and tax invoice to us for close case.
Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933)

From: Operation / Candy Ong <operation@tlauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 8 January 2021 2:33 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Before paint photos and finalised for GBH7542R
Dear Shiau Chan,

Please find attached for your information and necessary action
Finalised amount $5,800.60 at 5 working days

Kindly revert soonest

Best Regards,

Candy
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd

From: Operation / Candy Ong [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 11:35 AM

To: 'Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)' <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Before paint photos and finalised for GBH7542R

Dear Kenneth,
Please find attached as per your request

Best Regards,
Candy



Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) [mailto:KennethKong@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, January 7, 2021 8:53 AM

To: Operation / Candy Ong <operation@tlauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Before paint photos and finalised for GBH7542R

Victor asking for the bonnet lettering invoice.

From: Operation / Candy Ong [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 24 December, 2020 12:09 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Before paint photos and finalised for GBH7542R

Dear Kenneth,

Please find attached before paint photos for your attention and finalization

Kindly revert

Best Regards,
Candy Ong
Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd



