Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Lim, Kok-Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 10:46 AM

To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Azlan, Syazairdina
Subject: RE: aigencrypt RE: AIG-OD GBH 7542R / 3753506952SG

Thanks Mariesa for following up, appreciate it.
Shiau Chan,

Please inform repairer to provide Tax Invoice for verification on the price $220 quoted in the estimate before
finalizing COR.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Lim Kok Chong
Senior Motor Surveyor
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120
Mobile +(65) 8876 5437

Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa

Sent: Wednesday, January 06, 2021 10:37 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Lim, Kok-Chong

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Azlan, Syazairdina
Subject: aigencrypt RE: AIG-OD GBH 7542R / 3753506952SG

Dear Shiau Chan,

We have checked and letterings are covered up to $1000.

Best regards,

Mariesa Abu Kassim (Mariesa)

AlG

FNOL Adjuster |

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Tel: 8001206556 | Ext: 1012202
NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com | www.aig.com




From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, January 5, 2021 5:51 PM

To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Lim, Kok-Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>
Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur
<Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG-OD GBH 7542R / 3753506952SG

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Mariesa,

Have any updates? As workshop keep chasing.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 3:46 PM

To: Lim, Kok-Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur
<Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Shiau Chan
(LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG-OD GBH 7542R / 3753506952SG

Hi Kok Chong,

Noted, will check and revert.

Best regards,

Mariesa Abu Kassim (Mariesa)

AIG

FNOL Adjuster |

Auto Claims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Tel: 8001206556 | Ext: 1012202
NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com | www.aig.com

From: Lim, Kok-Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>

Sent: Monday, January 4, 2021 3:38 PM

To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur
<Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>; Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Shiau Chan
(LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIG-OD GBH 7542R / 3753506952SG

Hi Mariesa,



Please check with UW if there is coverage for “Sticker Lettering” for Commercial advertising under this fleet policy
and let Shiau Chan has your advice to revert to repairer for finalization.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Lim Kok Chong
Senior Motor Surveyor
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120
Mobile +(65) 8876 5437

Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, January 04, 2021 3:23 PM

To: Lim, Kok-Chong; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Lim, Sheng Yang; Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur; Azlan,
Syazairdina

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: AIG-OD GBH 7542R / 3753506952SG

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Dear Sir/Madam,
Kindly assist to check the “TO SUPPLY AND PASTE LETTERING ON BONNET” with insured ?

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 December 2020 9:45 AM

To: 'Lim, Kok-Chong' <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>; 'Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa' <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>
Subject: AIG-OD GBH 7542R / 37535069525G

Dear Sir/Madam,
Kindly assist to check the “TO SUPPLY AND PASTE LETTERING ON BONNET” with insured ?

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



