Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
<BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 January 2021 12:01 PM

To: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Sun Pin (LKK Auto); Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims &
IA/Claims & IA/Buses); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & |A/Claims &
IA/Buses)

Subject: FW: Finalisation - SG5597A (BUS/11/20/5022) - NTUC

Importance: High

Hi Catherine,

TP party vehicle reg. no. should be SHD1564S instead of SHD1564F.
SHD1564S is insured with NTUC.

Country/State of Loss

Singapore

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number SHD1564S
INSUREDVPOLICYHOLDER
Is company? Yag

Mame Of Registered Owner

Company Reg Mo 200304975H

Email Address CLAIMS@PREMIERTAXI.COM
Maobile Phone Mo -

PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD

Alternative Phone No
VEHICLE PARTICULARS

Manufacturer
Model
Variant

accident

your vehicle?
Vehicle Category

INSURAMCE COMPAMNY

Mame of Insurance Company
Type of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Paolicy Mumber

Cover Mote Number

Exact purpose for which vehicle was being used at time of

Are you claiming under your own insurance palicy for repair to

Hyundai
130 (FD} 1.6 DOHC (A)

Mo - Claiming third party
Taxi

NTUC
ThirdPartyFireTheft
Yes
5107202885-01

Best Regards
Balgish

Automotive Services | Claims & Insurance Agency | DID

: 6556 3547 | Email : balgishbah@smrt.com.sg
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From: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses)

Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 4:38 PM

To: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

Cc: veronchen@Ikkauto.com; sunpin@lkkauto.com; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims &
IA/Buses); Tan Wei Teck (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)

Subject: FW: Finalisation - SG5597A (BUS/11/20/5022) - NTUC

Hi Balgish,

This case is pending for finalisation.
Please kindly response as per LKK’s queries soonest possible.

Thank you

Regards
Catherine Lee

From: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses)

Sent: 12 January 2021 16:36

To: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses)
Cc: veronchen@Ilkkauto.com; sunpin@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: FW: Finalisation - SG5597A (BUS/11/20/5022) - NTUC

Hi Balgish,
Please assist.
Thank you

Regards
Catherine Lee

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: 12 January 2021 15:38

To: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses); SUR
Cc: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Finalisation - SG5597A (BUS/11/20/5022) - NTUC

Dear Catherine,
Please be informed that SHD 1564F not insured with NTUC.

Kindly advised.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Catherine Lee Sau Chan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Buses) <catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 January 2021 10:27 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Koo Yew Chung (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC) <YewChung@smrt.com.sg>; AutoSvs-ARC (Bus) <AutoSvs-
ARCBus@smrt.com.sg>; Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation - SG5597A (BUS/11/20/5022) - NTUC

Hi Veron,

Attached herewith our copy and Surveyor’s marked copy of the bus repair estimate for the case.
Our finalised amount is $1,550/- @ 2 working day under lump sum repair. Attached repair photos for your perusal.

Please confirm the COR by return email ASAP.

Thank you

Best Regards

Catherine Lee

SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
(Accident Repair Centre)

DID: 6866 2669 Fax: 6368 5592
catherineleesc@smrt.com.sg

@Smm'
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