Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 3:10 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: slq 4720y - Finalize

Hi Steve.. | confirmed with the finalized offer for this case. Thanks..

Best regards
Winson tan
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From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 8, 2020 3:06:24 PM

To: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: slq 4720y - Finalize

HI Winson,

Kindly refer our amend finalize $2950 (L/S, before GST). 6 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 8 December 2020 2:54 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: slq 4720y - Finalize

Hi Steve.. for this finalized calculation wrong.. for the labour is total 1320. Please correct it again. Thanks.
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From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, December 7, 2020 9:09:24 PM

To: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: slq 4720y - Finalize

Hi Winson,
Kindly refer our finalize $2850 (L/S, before GST). 6 repair days.

Kindly confirm

Thanks.

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Winson Tan [mailto:winson_tingwei@hotmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, December 05, 2020 5:57 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: slq 4720y after paint done photos

hi steve..after paint done photos for slg 4720y.. thanks..

best regards
winson tan
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