Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Fenny Seah <fennyskl@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 3, 2020 10:50 AM
To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Accident claim for FBK8826A
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Hi Officer,

We confirm the finalised amount of $1650, exclusive of GST, repair day 3 days.

Thank you.

Best regards,
Fenny Seah

Sin Boon Motor Co.
10 Admiralty Street, #01-10/11 Northlink Building, S757695

On 2 Dec 2020, at 17:32, Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sir,
Kindly refer the finalize amount $1,650. Repair day 3 days. (L/S, before gst).
Thank you

Best Regards,
Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

From: sbmotor@singnet.com.sg [mailto:sbmotor@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, December 2, 2020 1:55 PM

To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident claim for FBK8826A

Hi Officer,



