Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Friday, 15 January 2021 12:00 PM
ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; thanaraj@panpacificleasing.com.sg;

Jessie Ong; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ppemclaims@gmail.com; SUR

From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:

RE: GBK3085D OD FINALIZE - DOA:22/11/2020

Subject:

Dear Jessie,
Thank you for the confirmation
The claim no. is OD / MFL2020D0002503

Best Regards,
Celine Fong
phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jessie Ong <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 15 January 2021 11:53 AM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Shirley

Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg; thanaraj@panpacificleasing.com.sg; edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg;

ppemclaims@gmail.com; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBK3085D OD FINALIZE - DOA:22/11/2020

Dear Celine,
We confirm finalisation at $14,250.00 before excess

Please send me the claim no. for DV submission

Thanks

Regards,
Jessie Ong
Accident Claim Supervisor

Tel: +65 8723 3003

| jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg
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PAN PACIFIC VAN & TRUCK LEASING PTE LTD

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
56 Loyang Way, #06-07,Loyang Enterprise Building,Singapore 508775
www.PanPacificLeasing.com.sg

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, January 15, 2021 9:39 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jessie Ong ' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
thanaraj@panpacificleasing.com.sg; edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ppemclaims@gmail.com; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GBK3085D OD FINALIZE - DOA:22/11/2020

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Base on the marked estimate, we have computed the repair cost at L/S $14,250.00 &14 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 January 2021 10:51 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jessie Ong ' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
thanaraj@panpacificleasing.com.sg; edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ppemclaims@gmail.com; SUR
<sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: GBK3085D OD FINALIZE - DOA:22/11/2020

Hi Shirley,

I've checked the finalize. Kindly assist below email finalize amount.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 January 2021 10:46 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jessie Ong ' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg
<ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; thanaraj@panpacificleasing.com.sg <thanaraj@panpacificleasing.com.sg>;
edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg <edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg>

Subject: GBK3085D OD FINALIZE - DOA:22/11/2020

Hi Steve,
We will undertake the repair of this vehicle at COR L/S $15,000.00 (before GST & excess) & 14 repair days.
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
56 Loyang Way, #06-07,Loyang Enterprise Building, Singapore 508775




