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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>

Sent: Thursday, 31 December 2020 3:41 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Pila Ng; 'paulo.b@vermogengroup.COM; Vmg admin; Vermogen Ace; Luis Tan; SUR; 

Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: FW: SJJ5678R FINALISE

Without Prejudice, 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

My boss agreed to accept your revised finalise COR @ Lumpsum $5,400.00 (before GST) & 4 repair days (excluding 

PRS/RS/Weekend & PH). 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

On Thu, Dec 31, 2020 at 11:01 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Minoko, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 Finalize confirmed? 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 26 December 2020 8:57 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>; 'paulo.b@vermogengroup.COM; Vmg admin <vmg@vermogen-

group.com>; Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com>; Luis Tan <luis@vermogen-group.com>; SUR 
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<sur@lkkauto.com>; Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FW: SJJ5678R FINALISE 

  

Dear Veron, 

  

I checking with my boss, i will update you. 

  

Thank you 

 

 

Best Regards, 

  

  

Minoko 

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd  

Operation Address: 

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36 

Carros Centre Singapore 737869 

Tel: 6904 4596 

Fax: 6694 4929 

  

Mailing Address: 

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36 

Carros Centre Singapore 737869 

  

  

On Thu, Dec 24, 2020 at 5:22 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Minoko, 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Finalize confirmed? 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 22 December 2020 10:20 AM 

To: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; Vmg 

admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>; Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com>; Luis Tan <luis@vermogen-

group.com> 

Subject: RE: SJJ5678R FINALISE 

  

Hi Minoko, 

  

Kindly refer the finalize amount $5,400 (before gst). Repair day 4 days under lump sum repair. 

  

Please confirm the COR by reply email. 

  

Thank you 

  

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
  
LKK Auto Consultants 
  
Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933 

  

  

  

From: Minoko Chan [mailto:minoko@vermogen-group.com]  

Sent: Monday, December 7, 2020 9:42 AM 
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To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>; Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>; Vmg 

admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>; Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com>; Luis Tan <luis@vermogen-

group.com> 

Subject: Fwd: SJJ5678R FINALISE 

  

Without Prejudice, 

  

Dear Veron & Sun Pin, 

  

Please refer to attachments, kindly check & confirm finalize COR @ Lumpsum $6,650.00 (before GST) & 5 repair 

days (excluding PRS/RS/WEEKEND/PH). 

 

Thank you.  

  

Best Regards, 

  

  

Minoko 

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd  

Operation Address: 

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36 

Carros Centre Singapore 737869 

Tel: 6904 4596 

Fax: 6694 4929 

  

Mailing Address: 

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36 

Carros Centre Singapore 737869 

  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Minoko Chan <minoko@vermogen-group.com> 

Date: Thu, Dec 3, 2020 at 12:34 PM 

Subject: SJJ5678R FINALISE 

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <SunPin@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Pila Ng <pila@vermogen-group.com>, Baldoz Juan Paulo Bongon <paulo.b@vermogen-group.com>, Vmg 

admin <vmg@vermogen-group.com>, Vermogen Ace <ace@vermogen-group.com>, Luis Tan <luis@vermogen-

group.com> 
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Without Prejudice, 

  

Dear Sun Pin, 

  

Please refer to attachments, kindly check & confirm finalize COR @ Lumpsum $6,650.00 (before GST) & 5 repair 

days (excluding PRS/RS/WEEKEND/PH). 

 

Thank you.  

  

Best Regards, 

  

  

Minoko 

Vermogen Ace Pte Ltd  

Operation Address: 

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36 

Carros Centre Singapore 737869 

Tel: 6904 4596 

Fax: 6694 4929 

  

Mailing Address: 

60 Jalan Lam Huat # 03-35/36 

Carros Centre Singapore 737869 


