Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: enquiry@afcars.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, December 16, 2020 1:33 PM
To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Ref:SMG9093G

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Dear Sun Pin,
We shall accept the COR at $6,750 and 6 days
LOD shall be prepare and submit shortly

Thanks
Mike

On 2020-12-16 12:36, Sun Pin (LKK Auto) wrote:

> Hi Mike,

>

> Kindly refer the finalize amount $6,750. Repair day 6 days. (L/S,
> before gst).

>

> Please confirm the COR by reply email.

>

> Thank you

>

> Best Regards,

> Qi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

>

> LKK Auto Consultants

>

> Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51,
> Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933

> From: enquiry@afcars.com.sg [mailto:enquiry@afcars.com.sg]
> Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2020 2:47 PM

> To: Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@Ilkkauto.com>

> Subject: Ref:SMG9093G

>

> Hi Sun Pin,



