Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 November 2020 1:23 PM
To: ‘Alice Leong'

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZE TO SLW3996T
Attachments: est marking.pdf

Hi Alice,

COR 1/s$900, 2 days.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Alice Leong [mailto:aliceleong@primeautoclaims.com]
Sent: Friday, 27 November 2020 3:31 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINALIZE TO SLW3996T

Importance: High

Hi Taufikh,

Enclosed our after repair /painting photos & our calculation sheet for your retention. Shall we finalize at L/S
$900/- and 2 working days

Please let us have your confirmation within three (3) days from our e-mail.
Thank you

Alice Leong

Manager, Motor Claims

Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

T (65): 6861 0908 1 F (65) 6515 2948
HP (65) 9818 4304

A member of the Prime Group
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