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LKK Paya Ubi
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From: Clarence Richard Anthony <clarence.anthony@income.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 November 2020 7:58 am
To: 'rspu@lkkauto.com’; Teng Ken Leong; ODsupport
Subject: FW: Vehicle number SMR 193C DOA 22112020
Attachments: SMR193C_22112020.PDF; SMR 193C_SKETCH PLAN0003.jpg; DSCN9461.JPG;

DSCN9462.JPG; DSCN9463.JPG; DSCN9464.JPG; DSCN9465.JPG; DSCN9466.JPG;
DSCN9467.JPG; DSCN9468.JPG; DSCN9469.JPG; DSCN9470.JPG; DSCN9471.JPG

Importance: High

Hi Jackson

There is an issue with the policy. We are checking backend on this. Once it is resolved, we will create the case file and
advice the claim number to you for billing purposes.

Regards

Clarence Anthony

Manager

Operations, Motor and Personal Lines
T +65 6430 7877
www.income.com.sg

(7 Income

made different

From: LKK Paya Ubi [mailto:rspu@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: 24 November, 2020 6:09 PM

To: Clarence Richard Anthony <clarence.anthony@income.com.sg>
Cc: Teng Ken Leong <kenleong.teng@income.com.sg>

Subject: FW: Vehicle number SMR 193C DOA 22112020
Importance: High

[CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless
you can confirm the sender and know the content is safe.]

Dear All,

There was no response at your end.

Best Regards,
Jackson Ho| Admin



National Assessment Centre Services (LKK Group)
Phone: 6841-0055 | email: rspu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-6315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: LKK Paya Ubi [mailto:rspu@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 5:01 pm

To: 'Desmond Foo Guo Hui' <desmond.foogh@income.com.sg>

Cc: 'ODsupport' <ODsupport@income.com.sg>; Theresa Vimala (thrsvim.bala@income.com.sg)

<thrsvim.bala@income.com.sg>
Subject: Vehicle number SMR 193C DOA 22112020

Importance: High

Dear Desmond,

Above mentioned vehicle, Ebao cannot created. Attachment is the photo, GIA report and driver IC & DL. Please give me

the claims number to billing the invoice.

Best Regards,

Jackson Ho| Admin

National Assessment Centre Services (LKK Group)

Phone: 6841-0055 | email: rspu@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-6315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s)
named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all
copies of it. Thank you.



